Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 10:30 AM
To: Eulindra Sim

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Photos of Parts (SKR8088U)

Hi Eulindra,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of P/P $12,967.30 before GST/- with
07 days of repair, as quoted In invoice,
subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Eulindra Sim <eulindrasim@tts.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 August 2022 9:06 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Shabir' <shabir@tts.com.sg>; colinliew@tts.com.sg <colinliew@tts.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Photos of Parts (SKR8088U)

Hi Rasul,

Please find attached the final diagnostics report for SKR8088U.

Best regards

Eulindra Sim

Executive, Motor Claims
T: (65) 6757 2622 Ext 128 | M: (65) 9763 7000

We are committed to the preservation of the environment. Please print this email only if it is absolutely necessary.

TTS Motor Group Pte Ltd (UEN: 1987029992)

TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd (UEN: 200413930H)

383 Sin Ming Drive TTS Centre Singapore 575717

Website: www.tts.com.sg

Disclaimer: The information contained in this email, including any attachments, may contain confidential information of TTS Motor Group Pte
Ltd / TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd. This email is intended only for the use of the addressee(s) listed above. Unauthorized review, dissemination or any
other use of the information contained in this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error or have reason to believe that
you are not authorized to receive it, please notify the sender by return email and promptly delete this email . Thank you for your cooperation.



From: Eulindra Sim [mailto:eulindrasim@tts.com.sg]

Sent: 21 July, 2022 3:05 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Shabir' <shabir@tts.com.sg>; 'colinliew@tts.com.sg' <colinliew@tts.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Photos of Parts (SKR8088U)

Dear Rasul,

More photos of the parts attached.

Best regards

Eulindra Sim
Executive, Motor Claims
T: (65) 6757 2622 Ext 128 | M: (65) 9763 7000

We are committed to the preservation of the environment. Please print this email only if it is absolutely necessary.
TTS Motor Group Pte Ltd (UEN: 1987029992)

TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd (UEN: 200413930H)

383 Sin Ming Drive TTS Centre Singapore 575717

Website: www.tts.com.sg
Disclaimer: The information contained in this email, including any attachments, may contain confidential information of TTS Motor Group Pte

Ltd / TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd. This email is intended only for the use of the addressee(s) listed above. Unauthorized review, dissemination or any
other use of the information contained in this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error or have reason to believe that
you are not authorized to receive it, please notify the sender by return email and promptly delete this email . Thank you for your cooperation.

From: Eulindra Sim [mailto:eulindrasim@tts.com.sg]

Sent: 13 July, 2022 5:07 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Shabir' <shabir@tts.com.sg>; 'colinliew@tts.com.sg' <colinliew@tts.com.sg>
Subject: Photos of Parts (SKR8088U)

Dear Rasul,

Please find attached the photos of the parts. Do let me know if | missed out any.

Best regards

Eulindra Sim
Executive, Motor Claims
T: (65) 6757 2622 Ext 128 | M: (65) 9763 7000

We are committed to the preservation of the environment. Please print this email only if it is absolutely necessary.

TTS Motor Group Pte Ltd (UEN: 1987029992)

TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd (UEN: 200413930H)

383 Sin Ming Drive TTS Centre Singapore 575717

Website: www.tts.com.sg

Disclaimer: The information contained in this email, including any attachments, may contain confidential information of TTS Motor Group Pte
Ltd / TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd. This email is intended only for the use of the addressee(s) listed above. Unauthorized review, dissemination or any
other use of the information contained in this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error or have reason to believe that
you are not authorized to receive it, please notify the sender by return email and promptly delete this email . Thank you for your cooperation.



