Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 4:21 PM

To: 'Janet Tan'

Cc: dannysk yeo; Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SMC9657B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002017/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GZ 2054L(HINA TAIPING) / SMC 9657B/ OTHER ON 01/03/2022]

Attachments: DV_SMC9657B.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Janet,
As spoken earlier, we confirm settlement at $12,187.45(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client’s authorization to act to us (LKK) for
our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 5:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMC9657B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002017/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2054L(HINA
TAIPING) / SMC 9657B/ OTHER ON 01/03/2022]

Dear Hsiao,

Please accept our request to settlement at a global sum of $13,000.00 (all-in).
Thank you!



Regards,
Janet Tan

On Fri, Jun 3, 2022 at 12:34 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $12,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 2:56 PM




To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMC9657B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002017/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2054L(HINA
TAIPING) / SMC 9657B/ OTHER ON 01/03/2022]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Well noted, thanks.

Please keep me informed.

Regards,

Janet Tan

On Mon, May 23, 2022 at 9:46 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Janet,

We are preparing report to seek mandate from our principal.

We will expedite the matter.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 8:00 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; dannysk yeo
<dannyskyeo@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMC9657B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002017/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2054L(HINA
TAIPING) / SMC 9657B/ OTHER ON 01/03/2022]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please let us have your result for this matter, thank you!

Regards,

Janet Tan

On Thu, Apr 7, 2022 at 5:10 PM Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao,

Our Ref: sMc9657B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002017/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2054L(CHINA
TAIPING) / SMC 9657B/ OTHER ON 01/03/2022]



We act for Mr. Goh Teck Hong Paul, the owner of motor vehicle no. SMC9657X.

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you/your insured in
connection with a road traffic accident on 01/03/2022 INVOLVING VEHICLES

NOS. SMC9657B AND GZ 2054L ALONG CTE TOWARDS SLE/TPE LANE 2
BEFORE TIONG BAHRU ROAD EXIT 1B involving our client’s vehicle registration
number SMC9657B and vehicle registration number GZ 2054L driven by your
insured at the material time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving
and /or management of your insured vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s
vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, particulars of
which are as follow:-

Particular Amount

1. COST OF REPAIR & LABOUR $10,900.00
2. RENTAL FEE, 08 Days X @5240.00 per day $ 1,920.00
3. Pre-Repair Inspection for 2 days x @$240.00 per day S 480.00
4. GIA /LTA SEARCH FEE S 7.45

Singapore Dollars: Thirteen Thousand Three Hundred Seven and Cents Forty-Five Only

Total SS: 13,307.45

We enclose a copy of each of the following documents for your consideration: -
1. (a) Repair Bill
2. (b) LTA Search/receipt on GZ2054L
(c) Rental Fee

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s claim for damages pertaining to his
motor vehicle and any settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation
to his personal injuries.

Please confirm upon receipt.

Thank you!



Regards,
Janet Tan

YSK Auto Workshop

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 @AutoBay #01-71 Singapore 417883

HP#9248 1057

On Fri, Mar 11, 2022 at 5:26 PM Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Hsiao,

See attached as requested.

Thank you!

Regards,

Janet Tan
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On Fri, Mar 11, 2022 at 1:27 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SMC9657B Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002017/Aps3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2054L(HINA TAIPING) / SMC 9657B/ OTHER ON 01/03/2022

We refer to the above matter.

We would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary
action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)



