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Meng Yan

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 3 March 2022 2:00 PM
To: 'Shafawati Bte Md Rabu'; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: 'Justin Wong'; 'Derrick Quok'; 'Kenneth Lim'
Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10014073/KY || OI- SLD2585C (Blue) TP - FBN2354T || Est: 

$2,150.70 || Atan Motoring Supply Pte Ltd 

 
Dear Shafawati, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Shafawati Bte Md Rabu <shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 3 March, 2022 12:39 PM 
To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim 
<kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10014073/KY || OI- SLD2585C (Blue) TP - FBN2354T || Est: $2,150.70 || Atan 
Motoring Supply Pte Ltd  
 
Hi Team, 
 
We wish to appoint LKK to conduct PRS for the TP vehicle number: FBN2354T 

Atan Motoring Supply Pte Ltd 

Blk 3006 Ubi Rd 1 #01-370 Se 408700 

Tel: 67431351 – Anna  
 
 
Both GIA reports and estimate attached. 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
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Shafawati Md Rabu 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
T +65 6989 3697 
F +65 6725 0853   
E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct 
Insurance. 
 

From: anna sim <annasimsl@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 3 March 2022 11:04 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Claim against SLD2585C 
 

Dear Sirs, 

  

I am Anna from Atan Motoring Supply Pte Ltd a motorcycle workshop. 

Our  client has authorised us to help him claim against your insured for his motorcycle damage.  

I have attached the following for your attention and action :- 

Copy of our Estimate Bill 

Insurance report 

 Kindly arrange for survey at Atan Motoring Supply Pte Ltd 

Blk 3006 Ubi Rd 1 #01-370 Se 408700 
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 FBN2354T 

Accident on 1/3/2022 

Your insured car no. SLD2585C 

Thank you. 
 
 

Regards, 
Anna Sim  
Atan Motoring Supply Pte Ltd 
Tel: 67431351 Fax: 67434158 
email add : annasimsl@yahoo.com.sg 

  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, Easy 
Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The views 
expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto 
& General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended 
addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email 
is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. 
Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  


