Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 14:16

To: Advance Auto Garage

Subject: RE: LOD for Accident on 26/2/2022 between SMM3530U & SLR3094Y at/along 217
Sumang Walk MSCP

Attachments: LOCATION PHOTO.jpg; Ol VIDEO.MP4

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed a copy of our insured video footage for easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client fail to stop before
the stopline and collided into our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and
unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Advance Auto Garage <advanceag@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 May 2022 17:16

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: LOD for Accident on 26/2/2022 between SMM3530U & SLR3094Y at/along 217 Sumang Walk MSCP

Our Ref: AAG.20220207
Your Ref: SLR3094Y

Dear Asher

With reference to subject mentioned, we enclosed the LOD for your necessary actions.
1



Hope to hear from you soon. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Xavier Lim

(+65) 9007 9247

Advance Auto Garage

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #04-01
Vicom Kaki Bukit Inspection Center
Singapore 415933



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 11:40

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Khoo, Kay-Eng

Subject: RE: [URGENT] RE: Your Ref: 3074544256SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 3094Y AND

SMM 3530U ON 26/02/2022

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher,
Please proceed.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1946

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 07 June 2022 11:03

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Cc: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] [URGENT] RE: Your Ref: 3074544256SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 3094Y AND SMM 3530U ON
26/02/2022

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Hi Bernard,

We refer to the email dated 11.05.22.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any, third party is chasing for settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,



Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, 22 May 2022 14:43

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Cc: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 3074544256S5G // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 3094Y AND SMM 3530U ON 26/02/2022

Hi Bernard,

We refer to the email dated 11.05.22.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any, third party is chasing for settlement.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 13:02

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Subject: Your Ref: 3074544256S5G // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 3094Y AND SMM 3530U ON 26/02/2022

Your Ref: 30745442565G
Hi Bernard,
We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 3094Y AND SMM 3530U ON 26/02/2022

Both party video and location scene photo uploaded in merimen.
Third party traveling straight with a stop line fail to stop and collided into insured that is moving up the slope.

In view on the above we seek your approval to reject third party claim.
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Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



