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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 April 2022 3:48 pm
To: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: LOD   Re: Accident on 24/2/2022 involving SHB 1138A & SMX 8267P (AIG'S insured)  

Our Ref: TAX/02/22/2068/lg 
Attachments: 02 22 2068.pdf; SHB1138A - repair invoice.pdf; VIDEO-2022-04-13-15-43-05.mp4

Dear All, 
 
We quantify our claim as follows:-  

       
Cost of Repair $6,073.02           
Loss of Rental $1,377.09 ( 13 days x $105.93 ) 
Loss of Income $780.00 ( 13 days x $60.00 ) 

LTA Search Fee $7.00           
Total $8,237.11           

 
We enclose the following documents:  

1) Repair invoice  
2) Proof of rental rate 
3) Police/GIA reports  
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5) Hirer’s letter of authorization  
6) LTA search 
7) Video footage 
 

Our relief driver Ms Lim Ha Eng (NRIC No. SXXXX382G) is injured and had engaged her own lawyer to claim for her injury 
and loss of income (based on her medical leave). We are claiming the loss of income (based on downtime) on behalf of our 
hirer Mr Goh Swee Choon (NRIC No.SXXXX723F).  
 
Please acknowledge receipt within 14 days from the date hereof and let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 10:21 am
To: AJAY.CHAUDHARI@GMAIL.COM
Subject: <STANDARD LETTER> OUR REF: CC3/AIG22001906/Rga3 *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

SMX 8267P & SHB 1138A ON 24/02/2022 ***

Our Ref: CC3/AIG22001906/Rga3                  
                                                                                                 
14 APRIL 2022 
 
CHAUDHARI AJAY ASHOK                                                            BY EMAIL ONLY 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMX 8267P & SHB 1138A ON 24/02/2022           

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor 
Insurer (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under 
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SHB 1138A. 
             
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 3 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD 
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 198905369K. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(207091) M.G. MG5 EV EXCLUSIVE (M). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Clm Created
Reg No: SHB1138A. Acct Date: 2022/02/24. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt
d. (SG). TP Insurer: MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Strides Automotive Services Pte Lt
d (Woodlands)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/03/10 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
01 Mar
2022
11:37

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
14 Apr
2022
10:19

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] Chong

Pui Lin

12
20 Sep
2022
16:07

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

13
20 Sep
2022
16:07

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

14
20 Sep
2022
16:07

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2021/08/30.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
20 Sep
2022
16:07

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
20 Sep
2022
16:18

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

17
20 Sep
2022
16:27

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:7171.53:
Liability: 100%(B15)
*Quantum: (a)COR:6,073.02+ (b)LOR(7days x $105.93): $74
1.51 + (c)LOI(7days x $50): $350.00 +(d)Search fee: $7.00 = Total: $7,171.53
*5 recommendation re
pair days
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

18
30 Sep
2022
14:37

Video
Downloaded Downloaded 3rd Party Video [I] Ler,

Bernard-JQ

19
30 Sep
2022
14:39

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/03/10. Mandate Remarks: Subject to all docs in place. [I] Ler,
Bernard-JQ

20
30 Sep
2022
14:39

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:7171.53:Subject to all docs in place. [I] Ler,

Bernard-JQ

21
06 Oct
2022
16:02

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:7483.39:Hi, repair days should be 6days + 1 PRS + 2Sunday =9days, reseek mandate at $7,4
83.39(all-in).

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

22
11 Oct
2022
11:34

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2022/03/10. Mandate Remarks: Subject to all docs in place. To offer u
p to 9 days in view of DOA & repair period.

[I] Lee,
Ming-Yao

23
11 Oct
2022
11:34

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:7483.39:Subject to all docs in place. To offer up to 9 days in view of DOA & repair period. [I] Lee,

Ming-Yao

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
No record



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=98266690&CFTOKEN=e871f506c9e70d4e-461E4380-9D1A-DC6E-5EF7B324D2E59BEB&USID=3251&RID=8039982
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=98266690&CFTOKEN=e871f506c9e70d4e-461E4380-9D1A-DC6E-5EF7B324D2E59BEB&USID=3251&RID=8039982
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=98266690&CFTOKEN=e871f506c9e70d4e-461E4380-9D1A-DC6E-5EF7B324D2E59BEB&USID=3251&RID=8039982
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=98266690&CFTOKEN=e871f506c9e70d4e-461E4380-9D1A-DC6E-5EF7B324D2E59BEB&USID=3251&RID=8039982&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1071711%26extid%3D380539%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=98266690&CFTOKEN=e871f506c9e70d4e-461E4380-9D1A-DC6E-5EF7B324D2E59BEB&USID=3251&RID=8039982
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(Branch)

2770565 02 Mar 2022
12:55:20 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SHB1138A Low, Xianyu xx.xx

2770571 02 Mar 2022
13:00:21

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SHB1138A SMX8267P 11.00

2845461 20 Sep 2022
16:07:06

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SHB1138A SMX8267P 11.00

2845477 20 Sep 2022
16:19:03 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SHB1138A CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx
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