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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Falcoe Lee WF <falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 8:21 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Edwin Alegre (Porsche); Keion Toh; Admin A; ESPL - Claims Admin
Subject: LOD/TP RE: SMX6204J FINALIZATION *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22001828/Rgs3
Attachments: Letter of Authorisation.pdf; Discharge Voucher.pdf; Insurer Enquiry — GEARS.pdf; 

INV_LONPAC.pdf; Eurokars Auto Pte Ltd - Group Letter to Partners. FINAL 9 May 
2022.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Attached with our LOD submission 
 
COR                - $6,042.50 
Search fee      - $       2.00 
LOU                 - $   540.00 ($180 x 3 days) 
--------------------------------------------------------- 
Total                - $6,584.50 
 
Kindly make payment to ”Eurokars Auto Pte Ltd”. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
 
Falcoe 
 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 26 October 2022 12:49 PM 
To: Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Edwin Alegre (Porsche) <edwin.alegre@porsche.com.sg>; renan.yaguel@porsche.com.sg; Keion Toh 
<keion.toh@porsche.com.sg>; Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis Carlos 
<jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin 
<weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Falcoe Lee WF 
<falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell Goon 
<randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SMX6204J FINALIZATION *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22001828/Rgs3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Please submit LOD and claim documents for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 8:32 pm 
To: Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Edwin Alegre <Edwin.Alegre@porsche.com.sg>; Renan Joseph Yaguel <renan.yaguel@porsche.com.sg>; Keion 
Toh <keion.toh@porsche.com.sg>; Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis Carlos 
<jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin 
<weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Falcoe Lee 
<falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell Goon 
<randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Junior Soo <junior.soo.lk@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 
Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SMX6204J FINALIZATION *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22001828/Rgs3  
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Please find attached enclosed email self-explanatory. 
  
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  

From: Jobi Thomas [mailto:jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, June 7, 2022 4:30 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Edwin Alegre <Edwin.Alegre@porsche.com.sg>; Renan Joseph Yaguel <renan.yaguel@porsche.com.sg>; Keion 
Toh <keion.toh@porsche.com.sg>; Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis Carlos 
<jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin 
<weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Falcoe Lee 
<falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell Goon 
<randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Junior Soo <junior.soo.lk@eurokars.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SMX6204J FINALIZATION 
  
Dear Rasul, 
  
Kindly let us have your FCOR confirmation, thanks. 
  
Best Regards. 
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Jobi Thomas 
Senior Insurance Claims Executive 
27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042 
T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0682 F: (65) 6331 0690 
E: jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg    W: www.eurokarsgroup.com  
  
From: Jobi Thomas  
Sent: 11 May 2022 2:25 PM 
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com; rasul@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Edwin Alegre <Edwin.Alegre@porsche.com.sg>; Renan Joseph Yaguel <renan.yaguel@porsche.com.sg>; Keion 
Toh <keion.toh@porsche.com.sg>; Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis Carlos 
<jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin 
<weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Falcoe Lee 
<falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell Goon 
<randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Junior Soo <junior.soo.lk@eurokars.com.sg> 
Subject: SMX6204J FINALIZATION 
  
Dear Rasul, 

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.  

COR: $ 5,647.20 before GST. 

3 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH). 

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible. 

Best Regards. 
  

 
  
Jobi Thomas 
Senior Insurance Claims Executive 
27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042 
T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0682 F: (65) 6331 0690 
E: jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg    W: www.eurokarsgroup.com  
  


