EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 May 2023 6:02 PM

To: Thiam Heng Huat; EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: LKK REF : CC6/CTI22001777/gs3 OUR REF: SMJ1894Z TP: CHINA TAIPING *** LKK
REF: CC6/CTI122001777/Kgs39g2

Attachments: Invoice SMJ1894Z.pdf; receipt-20220224-095916.pdf; Car rental.pdf; LOA.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Lyna,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2023 4:18 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LKK REF : CC6/CTI22001777/gs3 OUR REF: SMJ1894Z TP: CHINA TAIPING

Dear Claims Team,

We refer to the above mentioned.

Attached is the repair invoice, LTA search receipt, car rental, LOA and below are the items our client
wish to claim from China Taiping Insurance.

1. Repair costs $2,945.94
2. Car rental 900.00
3. LTA search fee 7.45

$3,853.39

We look forward to an early settlement.

Warmest regards,



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To: THIAM HENG HUAT PTE LTD

RE:ACCIDENTON_22 2-22 INvoLving  SMJ 18G4 AND S¥A 13540
ALONG/AT PUNGGOL PLACE TEAPFEVC  TUNCTION
ywe__ MU CHPNGHONG NRic/yefi No;_ 3 2688AT3Z

oF _ BUC AA PunGacL FIELD §12-28L JINEAPORE g21004

‘j >
1. The owner of motor vehicle no: sMJ | g CM'Z hereby authorize Thiam Heng Huat

Pte Ltd to commence repairs of the said vehicle forthwith. |/We agreed to assign the whole
proceeds my/our third party claim to Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd. My/our solicitors (to be
appointed by Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd on my/our behalf) shall accept this as my/our
irrevocable authority to pay the amount compensated direct to Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
after deduction of their cost on a solicitors & client basis. | /We undertake to co-operate
fully with Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd and/or solicitors also with a true Motor Accident
Report/Police Report until the claim to a successful conclusion including court
proceedings, failing which, I/We undertake to bear all costs incurred.

. 1/We authorize Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd to sign all discharge voucher/indemnity forms
and all necessary papers on my/our behalf in connection with the above claims.

. In the event that third party insQrer issued the Agreed Settlement Cheque to me/us, I/We
undertake to either give the said cheque to Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd or bank into our

account and re-issue the cheque amount to Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd.

DATES THIS 13 DAY OF PER2UARY 2022

LA /VL

/
SIGNATURE OF OWNER SIGNATURE OF WITNESS

e iy S K



THIAM HENG HUAT PTE LTD

TAX INVOICE

176 Sin Ming Drive DATE 16-May-23
#05-14 Sin Ming AutoCare Invoice No THH230515
Singapore 575721 Vehicle No SMJ1894Z
Phone 82636295 Make/Model Honda City
GST registration number: 201605960N Date of Accident 23-Feb-22
Bill To:
Ng Chin Chye
c/o 176 Sin Ming Drive
#05-14 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721
NO DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Part by part repair costs $ 2,727.72
(Surveyor recommended repair days : 4 days)
2,727.72
8% GST 218.22
$ 2,945.94
TOTAL| $ 2,945.94
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THIAM HENG HUAT PTE LTD
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168 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
Co Reg No: 201934944C
176 SIN MING DRIVE,#05-14 SIN MING AUTOCARE, SINGAPORE 575721
Tel: 8263 6295 Fax : 6266 2881

Bill To : HU CHENG HONG Your Ref : SMJ1894Z
BLK 118 EDGEFIELD PLAINS B HONDA CITY 7 ‘
#09-306 —
SINGAPORE 820118 Invoice No  :R2022-02-0014
HP : +65-85333078 Due Date : 7 MARCH 2022

Payment Term: 7days from last rental date

DESCRIPTION | AMOUNT

| |

| RENTAL VEHICLE NO: SJK9434X |
| Model : HONDA CIVIC E
| Ref .Vehicle Rental Agreement No. RA22-0037 dated 23.02.2022 §
| |
{ |
1

: Being rental from 23.02.2022 to 28.02.2022
6 Days X $150/day $$900.00

| |
| [

$$900.00

|
|
! Singapore Dollars : NINE HUNDRED ONLY

Cheque is to be crossed and made payable to : 168 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
Interest @ 7% per annum is chargeable from overdue payment date.

Authorised Signature

168 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD



168 AUTO SERVICES PTD LTD
UEN : 201934944C

Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive

#05-14 Autocare

Singapore 575721

Steven (Hp : 8263 6295)

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT No:
HIRER'S PARTICULAR Veh No: STRG434 X Replace Veh No: S/ T/ 44 £
Name : (as in 1/C) Mileage Out : Mileage Out :
NRIC / PASSPORT No : Make & Model Make & Model
Address (Res) : Auto / Manual Auto / Manual
OutDate: )2 2.2022 | OutDate:
Name & Address of Employer : Out Time: ?77‘3‘& Out Time :
‘ RENTAL CHARGES
Occupation : DrivingExp: | Daily @S
D/LNo: D/L Type : Local/International Weekly @$
Pass Date : Date of Birth : Monthly @$
Tel: (O) (R) HP: ours @s
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS -
Lease Period :
Name : {as in1/C}
cbw @$
NRIC / PASSPORT No :
Pass Date : ' Date of Birth : . @s
Address (Res) : Delivery Service
HP: SUB-TOTAL$
Refundable Deposit : , IN
CaslVNsts/Chequa/VISA/MG Cards No : m m
(A - ACCIDENTS (D) - DENTS  (S) - SCRATCHES £ . M v
EXTENSION
Collection Service
Misc
ESTIMATED TOTAL RENTAL $

Sales Person Cede ;

[Hireris responsible In accordance to the insurance policy excess for
‘collision/damage to first part {1.¢.} YONG FA CAR RENTAL & SVC PTE
LTD Vehicle (Including windscreen) and also ‘excess for
collision/damage to third party’s vehicle for each amd every

accident/damage. ¥
ACCESSORIES CHECK .
(T3 Ashtray [T cig Lighter: Cssiwe Hier's Signature 1A
7] st0 700 {73 Jack [ Hub Caps
(] Radio/ Cass {7 coscanriages [Jsram Addition Driver's Signature

I/We agreed lo the terms and condltions above, overleaf and that all information given are trug & correct in all respect. My/Our driving
licenca(s) [s/are current and not disqualified from driving. You may charge all amount due on the rental lo my/our credit card.

* IMPORTANT

1. ONLY PERSONS ABOVE 2% YEARS OF AGE WITH MORE THAN 2 YEARS DRIVING EXPERIENCE. AUTHORISED, LICENSED AND SIGNING THIS
AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE THE VEHICLE,
2. VEHICLE 1S STRICTLY FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLYAND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGAPORE WITHOQUT PRIOR CONSENT OF THE COMPANY
RICALEASING PTELTD,
3. IN THE EVENT OF AN ACCIDENT, THE HIRER OR AUTHORIZED DRIVER :
{  shail report ol accidsents lnvolving the seld vehicls 1o the Owner immediately;
(¥} shas iske immadiate sieps to complele and eign Form MAR § (Motor Accident Repert Form)and So sl other acis required in compliance with the "NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT
REPORT SCEHEME" (the form will bs meds avaliable when the accident Is report to the Oyrery
(’} shad report 10 the poice within 24 hours irom the ocow o, the foliowing types of -
{8) Injury cese;
{b) son-injury cass laveiving 8 G wnsal vedicle, of damags 10 G property
(e} non-lnjury cese lavolving o foreign valicis (1o obtain thelr molor insurance policy. Passport No/Nsme of tho ddver, Vehicls number, Log cerd and Vehicla tad 1ax information)
{8) nonlnjury case kvolving & pedestnsn or cyclist,

RETURN OF VEHICLE-THE HIRER/DRIVER IS REQUIRED TO SIGN N THE COLUMN "SIGNATURE OF HIRER/DRIVER® FAILING WHICH THE DAY AND TIME
INSERTED BELOW SHALL BE DEEMED TO BE THE DAY ARD TIME THE VEHICLE IS RETURNED TO RICA LEASING PTE LTO AND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPTED
AS'CONCLUSIVE EVIDENCE OF THE SAME AND SHALLNOT BE CHALLENGED OR QUESTIONED ON ANY ACCOUNT WHATSOEVER, [

DATE IN| TIME IN | MILEAGE |CHECKED BY REMARKS DEPOSIT REFUND | ¢

b%\)\-} \'\\’) . SIGNATURE OF RER/DR}\?ER




Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220224-000731
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKA4359D
As at 23 Feb 2022/08:10:00

Print Date/Time :

Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enquiry - SKA4359D
Enquiry Fee
20220224095745156951

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
20220224095834278
Total

Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S%) (S9%)
7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
(Internet Banking)

24 Feb 2022/ 09:59:16
24 Feb 2022/ 09:59:12

Amount
After GST
(S9)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



