Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 9:26 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: CI/TP22001767/Dq

This one haven’t close yet? Can do today and ask account send out by today afternoon. Tks.

Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)" <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Date: 25 February 2022 at 13:15:50 SGT

To: "Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: CI/TP22001767/Dq

Hi Shiau Chan

Please close the above references number.

To collect $374.50 for each report before releasing report.

Contact email: fedwu@allmotoring.sg and matsumoto@shinetrust.com.sg

Invoice and report send to both email address.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




