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Meng Yan  (LKK Auto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 February, 2022 5:02 PM

To: assignments; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SGG7979K - BMW M135i xDrive Hatch - White

Attachments: SGG7979K-Repair Estimate.pdf; SGG7979K-GIA Report.pdf

Hi Yan 
 
Please assign Steve for this survey at PML tomorrow at 4pm. Please ask him to call me before going down 
to survey. 
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Freddie Chan <Freddie.Chan@lyjv.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 23 February 2022 2:13 pm 

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Jocelyn Wong May Khoon <Jocelyn.Wong@lyjv.sg>; Yvonne Chang Siu Wai <Yvonne.Chang@lyjv.sg>; Celine Fong 

(LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGG7979K - BMW M135i xDrive Hatch - White 

 

Hi Bryan,  

 

Please find attached for your reference as discussed.  

 

Cheers! 
 
Freddie Chan 
Senior Public Relations Officer 
 

 
Contract N103 for North-South Corridor 
2A Winstedt Drive, #01-02, Singapore 228001 
DID: +65 6668 2009 | Fax: +65 6327 1969 | M: +65 9758 5438 

�: Freddie.Chan@lyjv.sg 
www.leightonasia.com 

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 23 February 2022 12:37 PM 

To: Freddie Chan <Freddie.Chan@lyjv.sg> 

Cc: Jocelyn Wong May Khoon <Jocelyn.Wong@lyjv.sg>; Yvonne Chang Siu Wai <Yvonne.Chang@lyjv.sg>; Celine Fong 

(LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGG7979K - BMW M135i xDrive Hatch - White 

 

** CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 

recognize the sender and know the content is safe. ** 
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Hi Freddie   

 

Our automotive surveyor will conduct a physical inspection of the vehicle, assessing the damage against the repair 

estimate. He will make his recommendation on parts replacement if any and labour cost to restore the vehicle to its 

pre-incident condition after ascertaining the consistency of the damage. He will monitor the repair and thereafter 

we will provide a report to you on his opinion of the reasonable cost of repair. 

 

Our fees for this scope of work is base on the total cost of the estimate that is given by the repairer. If the claimant 

has provided the estimate, you may want to let us have sight of it in order to advice you our fees. 

Bryan Ang   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 

On 23 Feb 2022, at 10:41, Freddie Chan <Freddie.Chan@lyjv.sg> wrote: 

  

Hi Bryan,  

  

Good Morning to you.  

  

As discussed, we wish to engage your services to survey damages on a car. The car is currently in 

303 Alexandra Road. Please do let me know your charges and what services it comprises.  

  

Brief Details :  

  

Incident Date & Time : 13 February 2022 at around 11.00am 

  

Location : Along Keng Lee Road (Direction towards LTA HQ) coming from Thomson Road/United 

Square.  

  

Lane of incident : Extreme Right Lane – Lane 1  

  

Driver’s description on cause of damage : “Felt a deep dip and a corresponding loud impact on my 

wheels. After absorbing the impact, my dashboard warning indicators came on after a few seconds 

indicating tyre pressure loss. I drove to the nearest public car park (Farrer Tennis Centre) to inspect 

the damages.” 

  

Thank you.  

  

Cheers! 
  
Freddie Chan 
Senior Public Relations Officer 
  

 
Contract N103 for North-South Corridor 
2A Winstedt Drive, #01-02, Singapore 228001 
DID: +65 6668 2009 | Fax: +65 6327 1969 | M: +65 9758 5438 
�: Freddie.Chan@lyjv.sg 
www.leightonasia.com 

  

The information contained in this message may be privileged and/or confidential. If you are not the 

intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended 

recipient, please note that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is 



3

strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by 

replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Thank you.  

The information contained in this message may be privileged and/or confidential. If you are not the intended 

recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, please note 

that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your 

computer. Thank you.  


