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Re: Survey for Vehicle No :SHD1647L (TP claim) LKK REF : CC4/LPC22001764/Vps3

Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Mon 3/14/2022 5:02 PM

To:  'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Dear Gerald,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have inspected third party vehicle SHD 1647L at M/s PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE
LTD on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:
•             TP estimated cost of repair
•             Preliminary advice
•             TP GIA report
•            Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly provide us a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

 
Please note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong.

 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
 
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
 Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
                                                              
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Su Li| Admin Support
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 23, 2022 4:55 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Survey for Vehicle No :SHD1647L (TP claim)
 
 
 
Dear Sir / Mdm,
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Thank you for your assignment.
 
Repairer arraneg on 24-02-22.
 
 
Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 23 February, 2022 3:01 PM

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; boonkai.ng@premierauto.com.sg

Subject: FW: Survey for Vehicle No :SHD1647L (TP claim)
 

Lonpac External - General
 
Our Ref : TBA
 
Dear Summer,
 
FYNA. Insured yet to lodge report.
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Ng Boon Kai <boonkai.ng@premierauto.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 23 February 2022 2:42 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg>; Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>;
GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Subject: Survey for Vehicle No :SHD1647L (TP claim)
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
We refer to the vehicles mentioned above.
 
Vehicle to be Surveyed: SHD1647L 
Your Insured Vehicle: YQ230S
Date of Accident: 22/02/2022
Name of Workshop: PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES
Address of Survey Location: 23 Changi South Avenue 2, #01-02, Singapore 486443
Name of Contact Person: Boon Kai
Contact Number: 65446689
Email Address of Contact Person: boonkai.ng@premierauto.com.sg
 
*Vehicle in workshop*
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Kindly arrange for survey
 
 
Thank you
 
Regards
 
Boon Kai
Claims Executive
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
 
Address :  23  Chang i  South  Ave  2 ,  #01-02  S ingapore  486443
Tel :  6544  6689  Ext  071  |  Fax :  6214  1511
Vis i t  us  at :  w w w.premiertax i . com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential

or proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately

contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

 
P Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE
POLLUTION P
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