2/22/22,2:31 PM Yahoo Mail - RE: Accident involving GBF2849A & XD8579P at 47 jalan buroh on 13.02.2022/0840

RE: Accident involving GBF2849A & XD8579P at 47 jalan buroh on 13.02.2022/0840

From: apexi HKS (apexih@yahoo.com.sg)
To:  cynthiaang@income.com.sg

Date: Thursday, 17 February 2022, 09:34 am SGT

Dear Cynthia ,
Pls advise on the liability issue.
Regards

Chai
85498387

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, Feb 11, 2022 at 2:30 PM, apexi HKS
<apexih@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Cynthia ,

We have confirmed finalize amount of $5850 for the repair cost .
Please advise on the liability and we shall proceed with our LOD.
Thank you

Regards

Chai

85498387

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

Lim Chan Heng
Claims Executive
Operations, Motor & Personal Lines

T: +65 62026532

(7 \Income

made yours
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2/22/22, 2:31 PM

Yahoo Mail - RE: Accident involving GBF2849A & XD8579P at 47 jalan buroh on 13.02.2022/0840

From: apexi HKS <apexih@yahoo.com.sg>

ay, 17 January 2022 10:34 AM
u}i}éy <MTSurvey@income.com.sg>; MTSurvey <MTSurvey@income.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Accident involving GBF2849A & XD8579P at 47 jalan buroh on 13.02.2022/0840

Dear Mr Lim,

. IR LY
r XD8579P is it NTUC ?

Regards
Allan

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Mon, Jan 17, 2022 at 10:23 AM, MTSurvey
<MTSurvey@income.com.sg> wrote:

Classification: Restricted

Dear Workshop,
Thank you for your email.
The Survey/ appointment has been scheduled on 18/01/2022.

While we will do our best to survey the damage on site, there may be a situation that we
would need your co-operation to assist us to do it remotely via video. Our surveyor will
liaise with you accordingly.

Please ensure that the vehicle and the repair estimate are available. We seek your
understanding and patience that our surveyor will survey the vehicle at the earliest
possible time.

For future survey request, may we request you to provide the following information in the
format below.

Survey Type :

(New Survey / Resurvey)
Vehicle to be surveyed :
Income Insured Vehicle :
Date of Accident :

Date of Survey :

Name of Workshop :
Address of Survey Location :
Name of Contact Person :
Contact Number :
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Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220113-001338
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Result of Insurance Enquiryﬂ
As at 1 !

Enquiry Fee
20220113115124143674

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Print Date/Time :

Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
421808XXXXXX7506
Total

Cash Change

Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S%) (S$)

7.00 0.49
7.00 0.49
7.00 0.49

eNETS Credit Card

13 Jan 2022 / 11:52:22
13 Jan 2022 / 11:52:21

Amount
After GST
(S9)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Chapter 185) #Motor Vehicles (Third-Party
Tt Act. 1987 i) @Motor Vehicles (Third-

+ ;




. RESPRAY A
8, KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 , #04-06 ,PREMIER @KB,(415875)

Reg : 202106720W
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Tel: 82632225

Email: tfyong1966@gmail.com J
H e s

Vehiclie Number : GRF2B49A Date : 13.01.2022

Vehicle Model : TOYOTA HIACE Chassis : KDH2010193905

Accident Date : 13.01.2022 TP Ins, NTUC

Id
Original Reg Date : 25.08.2016 Ls fé_&f@ .
ESTIMATE

111 pc_|Front bonnet 2 985.20 | X_
2 12pc  |Front bonnet hinges vl -7 78.90 157.80 PX
3 |1pc [Front bonnetinner lock S 208.50 e
4 |1 pc " |Front corner panel RH Apas 285.60 |~
5 |1pc_|Front Bumper DS 598.20 { "
68 |1pc [Front Bumper towing cover ! 1p 49.80 jo—"
7 |1 pe |Front Bumper grille base ‘e 568,90 |, 41910
8 [1set [Front Bumper grille clips A Lr 30,00 |—
9 |1 pc_ |Front Bumper lower grille < 24580 | —
10 |1 pe |Front Bumper upper grille cra 385.90 |
11 |2 pes_|Front Bumper Side Retainers o/C c At 145/30 |igolo 29060 | (AC.
12 |1 pc  |Front Bumper Reinforcement Ly ’ 458,20 | =
13 |1 set |Front Bumper Clips e 5000 | "
14 |1 pc {Front Bumper Top Beam 1 7 379.80 | X
15 |2 pes |Front Bumper Reinforcement Side Bracket -1 7 138.00 276.00 X
16 |2 pc |Front Bumper Lower Side cover O/ 70.q 95.80 191,60 | /) ¢
17 |2pc |Front Bumper foglamp 0/ cna 326.40 652.80 | «p
18 |2 pc |Front Bumper foglamp covers /5 7oA 98,50 197.00 | (3
19 |2pc |Headlamps LED 07¢ cre | 306680 6.133.60 | ( p ¢ M1k
20 |2set |Headlamps clips A 7 30.00 60.00 | v
21 {1 pc |Air Con Condenser <1 -7 1.521.90 | ¥
22 |1pc |Condenser Alr Con Pipe A7 310.60 | -
23 |1 pc |Condenser Suction Pipe A 528.80 | &
24 |1 pc |Condenser Discharge Plpe A1 437,60 |V~
25 |1 pc |Front washer tank A1 158.20 | >
26 |1 pc |Front wiper gamish 71 245.80 >
27 11 pc |Front wiper garnish rubber seal v 7] 86.30 )<
28 |1pc [Radiator A 7 1,856.90 |X
29 11 pc |Radiator spare tank A A 205.80 | X
30 |1 pc {Radiator brace panel e 298.20 | X
31 |1pc |Front support panel /2 425.90 | >~
32 |1pc_|Front door RH PO/ 1,458.90 ,;
33 |1 pc |Front door weatherstrip RH AAA 198,50
34 |1pc |Frontdeor innertrim RH 11 528.10 | ¥ v
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35 |1set |Front doar innertrim RH clips i v 30.00 5
36 |1pc_ |Front door checker RH A 78.50
37 _|2pc_ |Front door hinges RH Tw 95.60 191.20 —
38_|1pc_ |Front door innerlock RH A 7 385.60 | X
39 |1 pc_|Front door step garnish RH 79 m 24590 | .~
40 i1 pc_ |Front door wirehardness RH 485.90 7<
41 11 pc_|Front side mirror RH 471_ 685.20 |
42 _|1pc |Front brake booster pump A7 1,859.60 | %
43 [1pc_|Front brake fluld pipe A1 258,90 | X
44 |1 pc  |Front brake fluid tank A1 485.20 | X
45 {1 pc  [Turbo Intercooler A 1,856.30 X
46 |1 pc_ {Turbo intercooler cover AN 385.90 X
subtotal 27,493.00
Less 25% 6,873.25
total 20,619.75
Special Nett
1_|1pc_|Front Number Plate with casing S (A 50.00 | #o
2 _|ipc [Front door company sticker A.e4 3000 | L
3__|1set |Front support panel sealant A 71 60.00 A
Labour charge
Panef Beating, to weld and align damaged parts 2,000.00 6 o0
Spray painting 2,000.00 QO )
Check Wiring on headlamp 150,00 | 2 0
Anti rust 12000 | 2o
Remove and install condenser ftop up gas A 100.00 | X
Check diagnostic of vehicle management /control unit “4-1180.00 | X
Repair and realligh chassis member A1 200,00 X
Total 25,509.75
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