3/17/22, 11:08 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Finalisation of SLN 8154X

MS Car Auto <mscarautopl@gmail.com>
Thu 17/3/2022 11:00 AM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Good Morning Mr Lim,

This is to confirm our acceptance of the finalaise of $6600.00 @ 8 Repair Days.
Kindly advise where do | send the LOD to ? Is it to your Office or Direct to China Taiping ?

Thank You and Stay Safe @

Warmest Regards,
Yap June
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838

On Mon, Mar 14, 2022 at 1:57 PM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@|kkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Desmond,

Without Prejudice
Attached is the adjusted estimate of SLN 8154X

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $6,600/- with 8 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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