Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 April 2023 12:56 PM

To: Finalization

Cc: SUR; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO

CONDUCT PRS

Hi,
We confirm acceptance of your offer $4400.00
Thanks

Ti Ti
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 11:49 AM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO CONDUCT PRS

Hi Ti Ti,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $4400.00 (L/S, before GST), 4 days. Subject to their approval.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 11:20 AM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO CONDUCT PRS

Hi Ti Ti,

Kindly provide after spray photo.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 10:42 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO CONDUCT PRS

Hi Sur,

This bike was already done repair .
May | know your Finalized amount ?

Thanks

Ti Ti
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2022 4:44 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO CONDUCT PRS

Hi Admin,



Our customer (FBL8211T) hasn't repair yet .
He is also waiting Police Investigation Result(PIR) .

Thanks,
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 24, 2022 12:30 PM

To: soumotorclaims@hotmail.com <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Bryan Lim <bryan@hoh.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO CONDUCT PRS

Without Prejudice

Dear Ti Ti,

We refer to your email below.

Please refer to our email with the law firm acting for your client.

Thank you.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via

email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F:(65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 24, 2022 11:34 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; soumotorclaims@hotmail.com

Subject: OUR REF: SNM22D200239/C02/SMU9786S/TANKL & YOUR REF: FBL8211T, TO CONDUCT PRS

Without Prejudice
via email only



Dear Kah Leong

Please refer to the below email.

Please conduct PRS FBL8211T soonest possible.

Please contact our claims department Kah Leong at 6389 6193, the officer in charge.

*kindly quote our claim reference number when replying*

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you

Natalie Leong
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F:(65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X¥3fil Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 February 2022 5:33 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: Third Party Claim - FBL8211T

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Sir,

Your Car - SMU9786S
Accident Date -08.01.2022 (11:30 AM)

Thank You
TiTi

Southern Motor
6273-0369



From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 23, 2022 4:56 PM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: Third Party Claim - FBL8211T

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

Pls advise:

Our car plate, date of accident and timing

To process pri.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be expected for
handling hardcopy documents. ~ All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 I F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com [ FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: KW Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 February 2022 10:49 am

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: Third Party Claim - FBL8211T

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi,

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know
whether the above motorcycle FBL8211T is authorized for
direct settlement .



Thank You

Ti Ti
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Southern Motor

Sent: Monday, February 21, 2022 12:08 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Third Party Claim - FBL8211T

Hi

We are acting on behalf of FBL8211T.
Kindly arrange surveyor ASAP.
Thank You

Ti Ti

Southern Motor
6273-0369



