Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: soon teck lee <teckleesoon@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 February 2022 4:29 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKQ 9053T(AXA) AND SLH 2735R

ALONG/AT JURONG EAST STREET 31 ON 19/02/2022

Dear Ms Chew,

Just spoken Mei Kwan on 24 Feb 2022 @15:45pm as you were in a meeting. | also called up
AXA and spoken to Karen 24 Feb 2022 @15:55pm to inform the incident on 19.02.22
@11:35am. The car already stopped in red light and the foot accidentally leave from brake
pedal to pick up thing to cause the slight roll to the front.

On the spot the 3rd party-Lian Yuege was alone and came out to see his bumper with no claim
of any injuries at all. If there is injury, he will definitely informed us to take the photo. He
requested me to pay an amount of Singapore Dollar Two Thousand S$2000/- for personal
settlement before we proceed to Insurance company on claim, which | disagreed. So we
exchanged Nric and handphone number to proceed to claim on insurance instead. Based on
both cars photo without anyone on the road between the 2 cars can caused the leg injury?

Can | kindly check if | am able to see the report that what the 3rd party claims against me?

Thanks & Regards

Soon teck lee
teckleesoon @ gmail.com
97379298

On 23 Feb 2022, at 9:43 AM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:




chewht@lkkauto.com

cst@axa.com.sg

chewht@lkkauto.com




Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



