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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 February 2023 10:21 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMP8888P Accident Date: 12/02/2022 Unfinalized

Dear Taufikh and Veron, please proceed close this case, thanks. 

 

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 

 

On Tue, Feb 14, 2023 at 10:13 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Yi Xin, 

  

Revised repair cost attached, lumpsum $3700 , 5 days. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 17 January 2023 10:02 am 

To: 'Xin Yun Auto Main' <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SMP8888P Accident Date: 12/02/2022 Unfinalized 

  

Hi Yi Xin, 

  

Sorry for the delay, please refer to attached, L/S $2950 , 5 days. 
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Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 16 January 2023 3:03 pm 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMP8888P Accident Date: 12/02/2022 Unfinalized 

  

Hi Taufikh and Veron, 

  

This accident case was at Feb 2022, both insurance and legal side is chasing me for the final bill.  

I tried to hold to let you have more time, but is almost a year, can you all please let me have by this week, thank 

you so much. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Fri, Dec 9, 2022 at 11:36 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Taufikh, 

  

  

Kindly assist to finalize-CS/ASM22001599/Tvy3 
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 9 December 2022 11:28 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMP8888P Accident Date: 12/02/2022 Unfinalized 

  

Dear Case Handler 

  

Good morning, please check and let us have SMP8888P finalise, thank you. 

Insurance is chasing me for the final bill, please look into this case, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 


