
1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 5:28 PM
To: 'Mdm Lim '
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022.
Attachments: DV_SFG1798S.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We confirm settlement at $1,691.00(all-in) as per you LOD. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Mdm Lim <kumchew1@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 4:10 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
 
Hi Ms Hsiao Tong, 
 
Refer to your below email. 
 
Please see attached rental invoice for you to make necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
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Best regards, 
 
Mdm Lim  
 
KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP 
160 Sin Ming Drive #05-08 
Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722  
Tel :64563715 Fax : 64557754  
 
 
 
 

On Thu Sep 08 2022 10:24:04 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
---------- Original Message ---------- 
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Mdm Lim, 
  
As spoken, kindly let us have a copy of rental invoice/receipt for our further action. 
  
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice 
basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal 
proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will 
materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, 
by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) 
| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
|  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 
S(408933) 

 

  
  
From: 
kumchew1 <kumchew1@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 10:06 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
  
Dear Ms Chew, 
  
Refer to the above matter and below email. 
  
Please let us have your offer soon. 
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Your early revert is much appreciated. 
  
Thank you 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Mdm Lim 
Acepac Rental 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#05-08 Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel : 6453 6256 
Fax : 6455 7754 
  
From: 
Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, June 16, 2022 1:07 PM 
To: kumchew1 
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Hi Sir/Mdm,  
  
We are in the midst of generating mandate report.  
  
Thanks  
  
“ 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice 
basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal 
proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will 
materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, 
thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is 
much regretted. 
  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| 
FAX: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
  
From: 
kumchew1 <kumchew1@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 1:01 pm 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
  
Hi Ms Chong, 
  
Refer to the above matter. 
  
Kindly let us have your offer soon. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Mdm Lim 
  
KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP  
160 Sin Ming Drive #05-08 
Sin Ming AutoCity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel : 64563715  Fax : 64557754 
  
From: 
kumchew1 [mailto:kumchew1@singnet.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, April 01, 2022 11:31 AM 
To: 'CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com' 
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
  
Hi Ms Cecilia, 
  
Refer to the above matter. 
  
Kindly find attached Invoice, rental agreement and LOD for you to make necessary action. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Mdm Lim 
  
KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP  
160 Sin Ming Drive #05-08 
Sin Ming AutoCity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel : 64563715  Fax : 64557754 
  
From: 
Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, February 18, 2022 12:08 PM 
To: kumchew1 
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
  
Dear Mdm Lim, 
  
Received with thanks. 
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Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan 
| Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com 
| fax: 67414108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is 
much regretted. 
  
From: 
kumchew1 <kumchew1@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 18 February, 2022 11:49 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 1798 S & SLL 1845 S ON 11/02/2022. 
  
Hi Ms Mei Kwan, 
  
As spoken, kindly inform your client to amend date of accident. 
  
Please find attached video footage as your requested and forward us your client full GIA report for 
our record. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Mdm Lim 
  
KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP  
160 Sin Ming Drive #05-08 
Sin Ming AutoCity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel : 64563715  Fax : 64557754 
  

 


