Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 February 2022 10:24 PM

To: Carine Yeo TCBC

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: SMJ 6678 Z - FINAL BILL

Attachments: SMJ 6678 main estimate.pdf; SMJ6678Z_FINAL BILL.pdf
Hi Carine,

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $4066.50 (P/P before GST) - with 3 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Carine Yeo TCBC <carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 24 February 2022 3:12 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SMJ 6678 Z - FINAL BILL

Good afternoon Steve,
With reference to the above-mentioned.

| have attached a copy of the Final Bill for your immediate aftention.

Repair Amount : $ 4065.50 + GST $284.66 = $4351.16
Days of Repair : 03 working days
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Need to replace this 2 item



No 14 - L52162-76040 - Plate, rear bumper - $18.40

Thank you and Best Regards

Carine Yeo
Motor Claims Assessor

DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1505 | MOBILE +65 9699 6192 | FAX +65 6476 6247
EMAIL: carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg

Inchcape — Borneo Motors | 2 Pandan Crescent, $128462
www.borneomotors.com.sg | www.lexus.com.sg




