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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 10:45 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: REF NO_ SNM22D201174C01 | Accident involved GBJ7346E and SH6455P 

along Crawford Street on 14/02/22
Attachments: GBJ7346E_GIA.pdf; Private settlement letter.pdf

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Please be informed that insured has a private settlement with COMFORTDELGRO. 
 
Regards, 
 
Irene Tay 
Claims Department (Motor Division) 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 63896192   |   F:(65) 62247478/62247175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. 
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 

From: claims@insurehub.com.sg <claims@insurehub.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 24 June 2022 1:41 PM 
To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; james.tan@skylink.com.sg 
Subject: REF NO_ SNM22D201174C01 | Accident involved GBJ7346E and SH6455P along Crawford Street on 
14/02/22 
 

 

Dear Irene / Claims Dept, 
 
 
Please be informed on the private settlement for the subject mentioned claim case. 
 
 
Thank you & Best Regards, 
Raney Tan  
Claims Department 
Insure Hub Pte Ltd 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Main Line: 6287-7077 
Business Whatsapp: https://wa.me/6591024443 
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-59 Pioneer Point (S) 627607 
Website: www.insurehub.com.sg | Email: info@insurehub.com.sg 

 
From: james.tan@skylink.com.sg <james.tan@skylink.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 24 June 2022 12:11 pm 
To: claims@insurehub.com.sg 
Cc: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Jeanny <jeanny@insurehub.com.sg>; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
Subject: Accident involved GBJ7346E and SH6455P along Crawford Street on 14/02/22 
 
Dear Ms Tan 
 
Hope this email finds you well. 
 
The mentioned accident had been settled between both parties involved. 
 
Attached the GIA report and the private settlement letter between both parties. 
 
Please assist to review the incident. 
 
 
Thank You. 
 
Best regards, 
 
James Tan 
Operations Executive 
Mobile : 9233 8081  
 
 

 
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify the sender. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual 
named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute, or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if 
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, 
copying, distributing, or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 
 Think Green. Please don’t print this message unless it’s necessary. Thank you. 
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From: james.tan@skylink.com.sg <james.tan@skylink.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 23 April 2022 2:37 pm 
To: 'claims@insurehub.com.sg' <claims@insurehub.com.sg>; 'Wee Hin Hong' <hinhong@skylink.com.sg> 
Cc: 'irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Jeanny' <jeanny@insurehub.com.sg>; 
'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING (GBJ7346E)  
 
Dear Ms Tan, 
 
Attached requested documents for your perusal.  
 

1) Rental agreement 
2) Driver’s documents 

 
 
Lastly, please update us the accident liability for my following up with the driver involved. 
 
 
 
Thank You. 
 
Best regards, 
 
James Tan 
Operations Executive 
Mobile : 9233 8081  
 
 

 
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify the sender. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual 
named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute, or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if 
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, 
copying, distributing, or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 
 Think Green. Please don’t print this message unless it’s necessary. Thank you. 
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From: claims@insurehub.com.sg <claims@insurehub.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 22 April 2022 2:57 pm 
To: james.tan@skylink.com.sg; 'Wee Hin Hong' <hinhong@skylink.com.sg> 
Cc: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Jeanny <jeanny@insurehub.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING (GBJ7346E)  
 
Dear James  
 
Thanks for the GIA report submitted.  
Please submit the hirer rental agreement , NRIC and Driving license urgently too.  
 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Miss Tan  
Motor Department 
Insure Hub Pte Ltd  

 
 
 
 

From: james.tan@skylink.com.sg <james.tan@skylink.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 April 2022 9:58 am 
To: Jeanny <jeanny@insurehub.com.sg>; claims@insurehub.com.sg; 'Wee Hin Hong' <hinhong@skylink.com.sg>; 
YVETTE@SKYLINK.COM.SG 
Cc: kevin@skylink.com.sg; charles@skylink.com.sg; irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING (GBJ7346E)  
 
Hi Jeanny, 
 
We have submitted the said report for your perusal. 
 
Thank You. 
 
Best regards, 
 
James Tan 
Operations Executive 
Mobile : 9233 8081  
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify the sender. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual 
named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute, or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if 
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, 
copying, distributing, or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 
 Think Green. Please don’t print this message unless it’s necessary. Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

From: james.tan@skylink.com.sg <james.tan@skylink.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 18 April 2022 4:51 pm 
To: 'Jeanny' <jeanny@insurehub.com.sg>; 'claims@insurehub.com.sg' <claims@insurehub.com.sg>; 'Wee Hin Hong' 
<hinhong@skylink.com.sg>; 'YVETTE@SKYLINK.COM.SG' <YVETTE@SKYLINK.COM.SG> 
Cc: 'kevin@skylink.com.sg' <kevin@skylink.com.sg>; 'charles@skylink.com.sg' <charles@skylink.com.sg>; 
'irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING (GBJ7346E)  
 
Dear Jeanny, 
 
My sincere apologies for the late response to your email, we are submitting the report latest by today. 
 
Thank You. 
 
Best regards, 
 
James Tan 
Operations Executive 
Mobile : 9233 8081  
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify the sender. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual 
named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute, or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if 
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, 
copying, distributing, or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 
 Think Green. Please don’t print this message unless it’s necessary. Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

From: Jeanny <jeanny@insurehub.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 18 April 2022 1:17 pm 
To: claims@insurehub.com.sg; 'james.tan@skylink.com.sg' <james.tan@skylink.com.sg>; 'Wee Hin Hong' 
<hinhong@skylink.com.sg> 
Cc: 'kevin@skylink.com.sg' <kevin@skylink.com.sg>; 'charles@skylink.com.sg' <charles@skylink.com.sg>; 
'irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING (GBJ7346E)  
 
Dear Mr Wee, 
 
Pursuant to our tele-conversation earlier, please assist to attend to this claim on a urgent note that CTIP is 
repudiating the claims soon.  
We would need the rental agreement to act on this matter and reporting urgently. 
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From: claims@insurehub.com.sg  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 8:23 am 
To: james.tan@skylink.com.sg 
Cc: kevin@skylink.com.sg; charles@skylink.com.sg; irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com 
Subject: FW: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING (GBJ7346E)  
 
Dear James  
 
FINAL REMINDER FOR REPORTING  

( SKYLINK VEHICLE RENTAL PTE LTD ) to do reporting at any of our authorize workshops .  
 
The details are as follows ; 
 
Insured Vehicle Number GBJ7346E 
Third Party Vehicle Number SH6455P 
Date of Accident 14 February 2022 
Time of Accident 19:45 
Location Crawford Street  
 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Miss Tan  
Claims Department 
Insure Hub Pte Ltd  
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From: Irene Tay [mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com]  
Sent: Monday, 28 March 2022 3:05 PM 
To: claims@insurehub.com.sg 
Subject: FW: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Please inform your client/our insured that this is our final reminder. Kindly please get them to lodge report 
before 7 April 2022. 
 
Regards, 
 
Irene Tay 
Claims Department (Motor Division) 
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909  
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175 
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. 
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 

From: Irene Tay  
Sent: Thursday, 17 February 2022 3:47 AM 
To: claims@insurehub.com.sg 
Cc: claims@insurehub.com.sg 
Subject: CTP REF NO. SNM22D201174C01 - NON REPORTING  
 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm,  
 
We refer to the above captioned matter. 
 
Please assist to get your client ( SKYLINK VEHICLE RENTAL PTE LTD ) to do reporting at any of our authorize 
workshops before 25 February 2022. 
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The details are as follows ; 
 
Insured Vehicle Number GBJ7346E 
Third Party Vehicle Number SH6455P 
Date of Accident 14 February 2022 
Time of Accident 19:45 
Location Crawford Street  
 
Thank You. 
 
Regards, 
 
Irene Tay 
Executive 
Claims Department (Motor Division) 
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909  
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175 
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. 
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 


