Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 February 2022 2:15 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Joanne Tan Jo Ann'; assignments; Admin A; SUR
Cc: ‘Jaclyn Maniam Kesaval'

Subject: RE: New Assignment-SKE 4200G

Attachments: SKE 4200G PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Joanne,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKE 4200G
Date of survey: 17/2/2022
Number of days (estimated) : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 February 2022 11:32 AM

To: 'Joanne Tan Jo Ann' <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jaclyn Maniam Kesaval' <JaclynKesaval@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: New Assignment

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thank you for your assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



From: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 February, 2022 10:56 AM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Jobi Thomas
<jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke
<stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell Goon <randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Derek Oh
<derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin
<weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok Wai Kee <eva.kok.wk@eurokars.com.sg>; Falcoe Lee Weng Fai
<falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>; Jaclyn Maniam Kesaval <JaclynKesaval@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: New Assignment

Dear Sir/Madam,

Attached documents for survey assignment.

Insured Vehicle No : PA8708U

TP Vehicle No  : SKE4200G

Claim No : D22000377MFBP

Workshop Name  : TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
Our Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Instructions : Direct Settlement
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