Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 10:16 PM

To: Boo seng yak; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SMJ9986P - TP NTUC - SURVEYED 15 FEB 22

Attachments: SMJ 9986 main estimate.pdf; PA01012022 - SMJ 9986 P - AUDI A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI -

FRONT - NTUC (TP).xIsx

Hi All,

Finalize amount correct. Please proceed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 4:05 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SMJ9986P - TP NTUC - SURVEYED 15 FEB 22

Hi Steve and all,
Revised estimate and photographs attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $7036.90 @ 5 days. Mr. Chang communicated with you via whatsapp on 16 Mar 22 for
checked items.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo



