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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 April 2022 3:05 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Catherine Chong Kai Ling; Hasrianah Binte Hassan; Lim Serene (MT

Subject: FW: YQ3529L and GBJ2081B TP Claims, Date of Accident 05 Feb 2022 at Tuas Power 

Plant

Attachments: YQ3529L DISCHARGE LETTER.pdf

Hi Veron, 

 

 

This case has been discharged, customer doing private settlement. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:  | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

 

  

From: Liew Si Ming  

Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 12:00 PM 

To: Lim Serene (MT) <lim.serene@income.com.sg> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: YQ3529L and GBJ2081B TP Claims, Date of Accident 05 Feb 2022 at Tuas Power Plant 

 

Hi Serene, 

 

 

Customer has decided to withdraw this claim, attached discharge letter for your reference. 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m:  | f:  | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 
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From: Lim Serene (MT) <lim.serene@income.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, February 18, 2022 3:28 PM 

To: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: YQ3529L and GBJ2081B TP Claims, Date of Accident 05 Feb 2022 at Tuas Power Plant 

 

Classification: Restricted  

 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

Si Ming 

 

We are unable to revert on liability as our Insured has yet to report the accident to us.  

 

You may wish to advise your client to revert to OD if the repair is urgent.  

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

 

 

Serene Lim 

Assistant Manager 

Operations, Motor and Personal Lines 

T +65 6430 7926 

 

 
 

From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 18 February 2022 9:22 AM 

To: MTSurvey <MTSurvey@income.com.sg> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; 

Hasrianah Binte Hassan <Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: YQ3529L and GBJ2081B TP Claims, Date of Accident 05 Feb 2022 at Tuas Power Plant 

 

Hi Annie, 

 

 

Please advise kindly advice on quantum of liability. 

Thank You. 
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Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t: | m: | f: | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 
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From: Liew Si Ming  

Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 10:10 AM 

To: MTSurvey <MTSurvey@income.com.sg> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; 

Hasrianah Binte Hassan <Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: YQ3529L and GBJ2081B TP Claims, Date of Accident 05 Feb 2022 at Tuas Power Plant 

 

Hi Annie, 

 

 

Contact number: Si Ming 97397127 

Thank You. 

 

 

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t: | m: | f: | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 
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Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) 

named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies 

of it. Thank you. 


