Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 6 May 2022 11:15 PM

To: Chris Ang

Cc: Heng Swee Hee; Foong Yao Jie; Boon Chin Lan; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: PRI for GBG8537E — Our Insured: SMB3548C ON 16/01/2022 Our Ref:
D22000422MFBP/SMRTBUSES/RW/TPD-1 - Authorise COR

Attachments: Finalise.pdf; GBG 8537 main estimate.pdf

Hi Chris,

Finalize please proceed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chris Ang <chris.ang@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 May 2022 3:40 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao Jie <Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Boon
Chin Lan <boonchin.lan@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI for GBG8537E — Our Insured: SMB3548C ON 16/01/2022 Our Ref:
D22000422MFBP/SMRTBUSES/RW/TPD-1 - Authorise COR

Hi Steve
Above attached is for your authorise COR
Thank you

Regards
Chris Ang

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 21, 2022 11:05 AM

To: Boon Chin Lan <boonchin.lan@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/FM&SuppSves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>; Heng Swee Hee
<shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Chris Ang <chris.ang@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao lJie
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<Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; MTPRI
<MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <siauchin.chan@strides.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRI for GBG8537E — Our Insured: SMB3548C ON 16/01/2022 Our Ref:
D22000422MFBP/SMRTBUSES/RW/TPD-1

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Boon Chin,
We refer to your email below.
We agree to direct settlement with quantum to be agreed.

Thank you
Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862
| Fax No. : 6507 3849 I[Email: rachelwu @msfirstcapital.com.sg ICompany Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of LAEEEW Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"'):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of
PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy,
Jorward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Boon Chin Lan <boonchin.lan@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, February 19, 2022 8:19 AM

To: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/FM&SuppSves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>; Heng Swee Hee
<shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Chris Ang <chris.ang@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao Jie
<Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI for GBG8537E — Our Insured: SMB3548C ON 16/01/2022 Our Ref:
D22000422MFBP/SMRTBUSES/RW/TPD-1

Hi Ms Joanne,

Can | check above claim status. Is liability clear & to our favors.
Thank you and have a nice day.

Best regards,

Lan Boon Chin

Customer Service Officer

KOMOCO MOTORS PTE LTD | 253 Alexandra Road #01-01 Singapore 159936
T: 68018914 HP: 86998507

From: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 4:36 PM

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/FM&SuppSves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>; Boon Chin Lan
<boonchin.lan@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Chris Ang
<chris.ang@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao Jie <Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Rachel Wu
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<RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI for GBG8537E — Our Insured: SMB3548C ON 16/01/2022 Our Ref:
D22000422MFBP/SMRTBUSES/RW/TPD-1

Dear Hua Yen,
For PRI.
Thank you and Regards,

Joanne Tan
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848 Fax: 6507
38491 Company Reg. No. 195000106C

A Member of [T INSURANCE GROUP
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

From: Boon Chin Lan <boonchin.lan@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 3:53 PM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Chris Ang <chris.ang@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao
Jie <Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Subject: Hyundai Starex , GBG8537E - accident survey for 3rd party claim

Hi,

Above attach for your attention. Kindly arrange for survey at our workshop. ( Car not in)
Thank you and have a nice day.

Best regards,

Lan Boon Chin

Customer Service Officer

KOMOCO MOTORS PTE LTD | 253 Alexandra Road #01-01 Singapore 159936
T: 68018914 HP: 86998507



