Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 2:18 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Subject: Fw: Finalization for PC7674D

case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 2:16 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Finalization for PC7674D

Hi Rasul
Ok. Please proceed

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136

Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road
(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Mon, Jun 6, 2022 at 2:13 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Winnie,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $8,000.00 /- with 06 days of
repair, subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 2:45 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>; Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Subject: Finalization for PC7674D

Hi Rasul

Attached is the after repair photos.
Pls let us have the finalization.
Thanks

Winnie Chai

Connect3
HP:9850-9666



