Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: AVRIL HO <avril@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 May 2022 11:03 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Suann’

Subject: RE: FINAL SETTLEMENT - GBJ8874R

Dear Hsiao Tong,
| will mail out the original documents to you today.

Our company’s bank detail as below :

Account Name MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
Account Number 006-011126-2

Bank Name DBS BANK LTD SINGAPORE
Bank & Branch Code 006

Thank you!

Best Regards,
AVRIL HO

Claims Asst.
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Email: avril@mova.com.sg
Address: Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3
#01-04/06/08
Singapore 159722
Telephone: 6272 3892  Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 May 2022 10:19 AM

To: AVRIL HO

Cc: 'Suann'

Subject: RE: FINAL SETTLEMENT - GBJ8874R

Without Prejudice

Dear Auvril,

Thank you for your email.

Kindly send us all the original documents for our further action.

We are moving to E-payment modes. Kindly let us have your company’s bank details for our necessary action: -



Account Name
Account Number
Bank Name

Bank & Branch Code

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: AVRIL HO <avril@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 6:20 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL SETTLEMENT - GBJ8874R

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Your ref : CC2/MIDA22001277/Ep
Attached is the signed DV, Tax Invoice & Power of Attorney for your attention.

Thank you!

Best Regards,

AVRIL HO

Claims Asst.

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Email: avril@mova.com.sg
Address: Blk 1008 Bt Merah Lane 3

#01-04/06/08
Singapore 159722
Telephone: 6272 3892  Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.
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Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.



