Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lee Chin Wah <LeeChinWah@greateasterngeneral.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 12:11 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Leong Lye Ping

Subject: RE: GEG Ref: V0056133 FW: Treasury Collision Agreement (“TCA") Enquiry -

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID51257 AND GBJ8874R(GREAT EASTERN GENERAL
INSURANCE LIMITED) ON 06/01/2022

Dear Madam,

Great Eastern General Insurance Limited is not a party to the TCA.

Should there be any evidence to prove otherwise, please provide it for our review.
Thanks and Regards.

Yours Faithfully,

Lee Chin Wah

General Insurance (Claims)

Great Eastern General Insurance Limited

1 Pickering Street | #01-01 Great Eastern Centre | Singapore 048659

Claims Address — 200 Changi Road | #05-01 | Singapore 419734
T: 6248 2345 | E: LeeChinWah@gqreateasterngeneral.com

F: 6327 3014
» Great ‘ INTEGRITY
INITIATIVE
A.Eastern | oUoNVEMENT

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 9:40 am

To: gi-motorclaims <MotorClaims-sg@greateasterngeneral.com>

Subject: Treasury Collision Agreement (“TCA”) Enquiry - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID51257 AND GBJ8874R(GREAT
EASTERN GENERAL INSURANCE LIMITED) ON 06/01/2022

[External Email - Exercise caution before clicking on links and attachments. ]

You Ref: GBJ8874R Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22001277/Epg2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID51257 AND GBJ8874R(GREAT EASTERN GENERAL INSURANCE LIMITED) ON 06/01/2022

We refer to the above matter.

We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military vehicles
with effect from December 2021.

We have settled the repair cost with your insured and we would like to submit Treasury Collision Agreement (“TCA”)
recovery claim for this matter.

Kindly confirm if Great Eastern General Insurance Limited is participating in Treasury Collision Agreement (“TCA”)
before we could proceed further.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

=== == CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This email is
only for the recipient named above and contains information which is private and confidential. If you have received
this email in error, please inform the sender immediately by return email and delete this email without reading its
contents or sending it to anyone. Great Eastern General Insurance Limited expressly disclaims liability for damages
resulting from errors and omissions contained in the information in this email. Great Eastern General Insurance
Limited is a member of the Great Eastern group of companies.




