
 
 
From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 25 September 2017 6:00 PM 
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Dear Lee Gek,
 
Further to the below ma�er.
 
Since there is no SD affirm by your client’s witness, our Principal instructed us to resolve your client’s claim @
Global Sum $1,500/- (all in).
 
Kindly let us have your acceptance.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 20 January, 2017 2:18 PM 
To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
Dear Jas,
 
We have verified with our witness and she informed us that you only asked her 2 ques�ons - if she is related to
our driver and if she is willing to tes�fy in Court.
 
Since you have spoken to our witness, please let us have your offer. Thanks.
 
Regards
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

FW: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our
Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)

   Reply all |

Sent Items

JK Jas Khine (LKKAuto) 
Wed 28/3, 3:18 PM

Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) 
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SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
 
From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA)  
Sent: 10/01/2017 11:57 
To: 'Jas Khine (LKKAuto)' 
Subject: RE: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
Dear Jas,
 
Please let us know if you have managed to speak to our witness. If so, please let us have your offer.
 
Fyi, we have rejected your insured’s claim on 28/12/2016.
 
Regards
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA)  
Sent: 03/01/2017 16:45 
To: 'Jas Khine (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A 
Subject: RE: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
Dear Jas,
 
Our passenger (Serene Ng) contact no. is 8299 6219.
 
Regards
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
 
From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) [mailto:jaskhine@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 03/01/2017 16:21 
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) 
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A 
Subject: RE: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
Dear Lee Gek,
 
Further to the below ma�er.
 
Kindly provide to us witness contact number for our necessary ac�on.
 
Thank you.
 

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Agnes Lim (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 January, 2017 9:16 AM 
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To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg> 
Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
Dear	Lee	Gek,

Thank	you	for	your	email.

Please	note	that	:	-

LKK	ref Of�icer	in	charge
CC3/AIG16022405/Syg3 	Jas

 
To	check	availability	of	the	case	handler	,	you	may	contact	the	undersigned.
	
"Wishes you a Happy New Year 2017"
 

Best Regards,

Agnes Lim| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: AgnesLim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 30 December, 2016 7:26 PM 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident on 22/11/2016 involving SHF 375S & SKG 5974P - AIG (Our Ref: TAX/11/16/2173/lg)
 
Dear All,
 
We quan�fy our claim as follows:-
 
Cost of repairs                   $2100.00
Loss of rental                     $  561.75 ($112.35 x 5 days)
Loss of income                  $  300.00 ($60.00 x 5 days)
LTA search fee                  $       5.00
                                                $2966.75
                                                =======
 
We a�ach the proof of rental, repair bill, laid-up report, GIA report of our taxi, LTA search and witness statement
for your perusal.
 
Please let us hear from you soon.  
 
Regards
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
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