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CLAIM NO : 21/22/22/VC00/025435 
DATE  : 02 SEPT 2022 
     

   DISCHARGE VOUCHER  
 
 
I/We, GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD  confirmed acceptance from M/s 
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of GBG 3585Z  the sum of Singapore 
Dollar EIGHT THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED AND SEVENTY ONLY 
($8,370.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all 
injury/property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC 
INSURANCE BHD  in respect of all injury/property losses sustained by me/us 
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from 
an accident involving GBG 3585Z and GBH 392C on 07/02/2022 along BKE. 
 
I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE 
BHD/ ZHANG STEELWORKS & CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD) against all 
claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in 
respect of the said accident. 
 
I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to  
VENDA ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE  LTD.                                                                                   
 
I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of 
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our 
insured’s recovery action.  
 
 
 
 
……………………………………..     
Signature of vehicle owner/Date 
 
 
 
…………………………………….. 
Name of vehicle owner /Date 
 
 
 
` 

Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd

02/09/2022
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 28 July 2022 10:08
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: FW: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 

07/02/2022

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Asher, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 4:52 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: FW: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 07/02/2022 
 
Hi Gerald, 
 
We refer to the email dated 10.06.22 
 
Third party is chasing for settlement. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  



2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 10 June 2022 16:46 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: FW: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 07/02/2022 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 10/02/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
 
The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. 
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer VENDA ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE  LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 14,581.31 $ 7,650.00 
2. Loss of Use (10days x $120) $   1,200.00 $ 1,000.00 (10days x $100) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $           7.45 $         7.45 
4. Towing Fee $        74.90 $       74.90 
Total $ 15,863.66 $ 8,372.35 

 
**8 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 10.06.22 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 18 April 2022 17:07 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 07/02/2022 
 
Hi Gerald, 
 
We acknowledge your email below. 
 
We will prepare our report and seek for your approval in due course. 
 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 18 April 2022 07:26 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: FW: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 07/02/2022 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Our Ref        : 21/22/22/VC00/025435 
 
Dear Asher, 
 
FYNA. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 15 April 2022 10:59 am 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Sky Chua <skychua@vendaengrg.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: FW: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 07/02/2022 
 
Hi Officer In-charge, 
 

Attached LOD document and ATA for your attention please. 

  

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Pei Jin 

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd 
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18 
Singapore 638892 
(Level 3_Office) 
(Level 5_Workshop) 
Tel : 8126 8587 
 
On Tue, Feb 8, 2022 at 5:00 PM Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg> wrote: 

Hi Gerald, 
 
We selected Mohd Rasul - LKK. 
Thank you. 
 
Pei Jin 
Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd 
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18 
Singapore 638892 
(Level 3_Office) 
(Level 5_Workshop) 
Tel : 8126 8587 
 

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

 
On Tue, Feb 8, 2022 at 4:41 PM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 

Lonpac External - General 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Our Ref : TBA 

  

Dear Pei Jin, 

  

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose our list of Motor surveyors for your 
attention:- 

    

1 Nicholas Tey–Appraisal   
2 Jackson Quek – Appraisal 
3 Joshua Ong - Appraisal 
4 Ang Bryan Tani- LKK 
5 Adrian Ling - LKK 
6 Kenneth Kong - LKK 
7 Thevan T Karthikesavan- LKK 
8 Mohd Rasul - LKK 
9 Marcus Chua –LKK 

10 Lim Teow Guan -LKK 

  

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days. 

  

  

Best Regards 

  

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 4:14 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Sky Chua <skychua@vendaengrg.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident Involving GBH392C with GBG3585Z on 07/02/2022 

  

Dear Officer In charge,  

We are repairing the motor vehicle GBH392C. Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention please. 
Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two (2) working days upon receiving this email. 

Kindly let us have your list of 10 nominated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.  

Kindly inform the vehicle already in our premises located at No. 8 Tuas Avenue 18, Singapore 638892. 

Please call 8126 8587 for vehicle survey.  

  

Pei Jin 
Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd 
No 8 Tuas Avenue 18 
Singapore 638892 
(Level 3_Office) 
(Level 5_Workshop) 
Tel : 8126 8587 

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

  

  

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
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