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Summer (LKK Auto)

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 7 February, 2022 5:31 PM
To: NG, Kwong Loong
Cc: 'assignments' (assignments@lkkauto.com); 'sur@lkkauto.com'
Subject: FW: Disclosure of Independent Survey Report : LOD \ CMTD2103633/AGC(nr) -  Letter 

of Demand (property damage) - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 3280B AND GBE 1311X 
ALONG KIM KEAT LINK ON 29/09/2021 AT 09:45 HOURS [LS ref: 
KL.21.00192(Muhammad Juwaidi Bin Norizan)]

Attachments: SURVEY REPORT & INVOICE.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We will like to appoint our surveyor/ LKK Auto Consultants to re-inspection on your client’s vehicle/ SMK3280B. 
 
Please liaise with LKK @ 6256 3561 on the appointment details at the soonest. 
 
Cc: LKK Auto Consultants 
       We will appoint your office to do re-inspection of SMK3280B. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Working From Home with effect from 03 April 2020 till further notice. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Agnes Chan 
Claim Divison 
D: 6329 5327 | T: 6461 6555 

 
 
Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. 
50 Raffles Place, #03-03 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or 
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are
not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 
Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated 
in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is 
permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy. 

 
From: NG, Kwong Loong <kwongloong@leagle.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, January 28, 2022 10:35 AM 
To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg> 
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Subject: Disclosure of Independent Survey Report : LOD \ CMTD2103633/AGC(nr) - Letter of Demand (property damage) - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SMK 3280B AND GBE 1311X ALONG KIM KEAT LINK ON 29/09/2021 AT 09:45 HOURS [LS ref: KL.21.00192(Muhammad 
Juwaidi Bin Norizan)] 
 
EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
 
Dear Agnes  
 
I refer to my letter of demand dated 8 December 2021.  
 
By way of discovery, I attach a Survey Report and an Invoice of $350 for the said report.     
 
I look forward to an offer soonest.  
 
Thank you.  
 
 
 

 

NG, Kwong Loong 
Director 
 

Phone 6292 2009/9389 1547  Fax 6292 2015 
Email kwongloong@leagle.com.sg  
7500A Beach Road #08-308 The Plaza Singapore 199591 
www.leagle.com.sg  

 
(The contents of this email are confidential. If you received it in error, please delete and refrain from disseminating it.)  

 
From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 December 2021 7:54 am 
To: NG, Kwong Loong <kwongloong@leagle.com.sg>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg> 
Cc: Elainesyms@gmail.com; 'Shirley Lim' <shirley.sym5033@gmail.com> 
Subject: LOD \ CMTD2103633/AGC(nr) - Letter of Demand (property damage) - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 3280B AND GBE 1311X 
ALONG KIM KEAT LINK ON 29/09/2021 AT 09:45 HOURS [LS ref: KL.21.00192(Muhammad Juwaidi Bin Norizan)] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Our  Reference: CMTD2103633/AGC 
Your Reference: KL.21.00192(Muhammad Juwaidi Bin Norizan)  

 
 
Hi Kwong Loong, 
 
We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents. 
 
Please be informed that Ms. Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 327/ 
agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg  
 
Please quote our reference, CMTD2103633/AGC and communicate directly with the handler. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
------------------- 
Aside to Agnes, 
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Please assist. 
 
 
 
Please be informed that our office will relocate to #03-03 at Singapore Land Tower with effect from 1 Dec 2020. Kindly direct 
invoices and business correspondence to our new registered address. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
[Working From Home with effect from 06 April 2020] 

 
Best Regards 
Grace Teo 
Claims Division 
D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555  
 

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg  
 
 

 
 

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.            
50 Raffles Place, #03-03  Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG  

 
Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or 
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are 
not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 
Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated 
in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is 
permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy 
 
From: NG, Kwong Loong <kwongloong@leagle.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 8, 2021 4:38 PM 
To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>; claimsreport <claimsreport@sompo.com.sg> 
Cc: Elainesyms@gmail.com; 'Shirley Lim' <shirley.sym5033@gmail.com> 
Subject: Letter of Demand (property damage) - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 3280B AND GBE 1311X ALONG KIM KEAT LINK ON 
29/09/2021 AT 09:45 HOURS [LS ref: KL.21.00192(Muhammad Juwaidi Bin Norizan)] 
 
EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
 
Dear Sirs  
 
Please see the attached.  
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NG, Kwong Loong 
Director 
 

Phone 6292 2009/9389 1547  Fax 6292 2015 
Email kwongloong@leagle.com.sg  
7500A Beach Road #08-308 The Plaza Singapore 199591 
www.leagle.com.sg  

 
(The contents of this email are confidential. If you received it in error, please delete and refrain from disseminating it.)  

 


