Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 March 2022 10:31 am

To: BRYANGOHZP@HOTMAIL.COM

Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC3/CTI22001094/Vga3 ***

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBZ 1177G & SHA 4724T ON 24/01/2022 ***

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC3/CTI22001094/Vga3
15 MARCH 2022

BAY CHEE FENG
DRIVER: GOH ZHI BING BRYAN

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBZ 1177G & SHA 4724T ON 24/01/2022

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken
up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized
driver may/may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 5 days i.e. by 20/03/2022, after we shall proceed with negotiation
with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any
claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular
accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence
should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be
in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,



Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Sunday, 27 March 2022 2:55 am

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl; Admin A

Subject: RE: SNM22D200695/C02/SBZ1177G/CHEESC  FW: Direct Settlement - Accident

Involving SBZ1177G (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHA4724T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI22001094/Vga3) on 24.01.2022

Hi Cecilia / Mei Kwan

We agree with your opinion that liability is down against TP.

Please proceed to reject claim.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is
to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks and Best Regards

Chee So Chow
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Main: (65) 6389 6116 1 F: (65) 6222 5879

Email : claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com I FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ I WeChat: AXfitf Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately.
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, March 21, 2022 12:07 PM

To: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Cec: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D200695/C02/SBZ1177G/CHEESC FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SBZ1177G (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHA4724T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI22001094/Vga3) on 24.01.2022
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear So Chow,

Attached is a copy of TP video footage.

We are in the opinion that liability is down against TP.

TP is moving out from the car park exit, while Oi is travelling straight.

Below is a screen shot that [ have extract out from google map on the exact accident spot.

Kindly let us have your instruction / approval to reject TP claim.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 March 2022 11:37 am

To: Catherine Koh Mui Gek

Subject: RE: SHA4724T AND SBZ1177G ON 24.01.22 *** LKK REF: CC3/CTI22001094/Vga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Catherine,

Based on your video footage, your driver is exiting the carpark gantry and our insured is travelling straight.
As such, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and not able to look into this matter.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be

made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 March 2022 11:10 am

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SHA4724T AND SBZ1177G ON 24.01.22 *** LKK REF: CC3/CTI22001094/Vga3

Dear Cecilia

Attached as requested. Kindly revert on our PD claim soonest.



