Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: ALEX LEE <hsautomotivespl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 March 2023 10:16 AM

To: Finalization

Subject: Re: CTI-TP SLP 1327A DOA: 25/01/2022 - Finalize
Hi

Agreed and accepted .
Tks
Alex

On Thu, 16 Mar 2023 at 23:50, Finalization <finalization@I|kkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Sir,

Kindly follow up finalize.

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $3750.00 (L/S, before GST), 5 days. Subject to their approval.

Thanks.
Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 8, 2023 4:15 PM

To: hsautomotivespl@gmail.com <hsautomotivespl@gmail.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: CTI-TP SLP 1327A DOA: 25/01/2022 - Finalize

Hi Sir,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $3750.00 (L/S, before GST), 5 days. Subject to their approval.

Thanks.
Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



T:65381368
F: 65381367

Kindly reply upon receipt of this email. Thank you very much.

BLK 2 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #02-25
SINGAPORE 417921.

This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is
addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or
otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



