Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 February 2022 8:44 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); assignments; SUR; ‘Harminder Kaur’;
ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Subject: RE: D22000279MFQC/PTE/CL Direct Settlement involving vehicle SKU9660U (Ours)
& SMQ2893H (Your Insured) DOA: 24/01/2022.

Attachments: SKU 9660U PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKU 9660U
Date of survey: 3/2/2022
Number of days (estimated) : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 10:43 AM

To: assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: D22000279MFQC/PTE/CL Direct Settlement involving vehicle SKU9660U (Ours) & SMQ2893H
(Your Insured) DOA: 24/01/2022.

Hi
Kindly assist.
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"'

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Harminder Kaur [mailto:Harminder @ msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, January 28, 2022 10:29 AM




To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim @ msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo @wearnes.com>

Subject: RE: D22000279MFQC/PTE/CL Direct Settlement involving vehicle SKU9660U (Ours) & SMQ2893H
(Your Insured) DOA: 24/01/2022.

Dear Sirs,
Enclosed is our survey assignment.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
A Member of LiEEW Insurance Group

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 [Reg. No. 195000106C

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo @wearnes.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 8:32 am

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SKU9660U (Ours) & SMQ2893H (Your Insured) DOA:
24/01/2022.

Importance: High

REMINDER.

Dear officer-in-charge,

Please arrange our client's vehicle for a pre-repair survey today?
Request for online survey.

Besides, kindly check the liability on the said incident.

Kindly revert to us as soon as possible.

Best Regards.

Paulo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 98270463
WEARNES Www.wearnesauto.com  juan.paulo@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.
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From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

Sent: Thursday, 27 January 2022 5:26 pm

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SKU9660U (Ours) & SMQ2893H (Your Insured) DOA: 24/01/2022.
Importance: High

Dear officer-in-charge,

Please arrange our client's vehicle for a pre-repair survey on 28 January 2022 (Friday).
Customer will come 11am, waiting.

Besides, kindly check the liability on the said incident.

Kindly revert to us as soon as possible.

Best Regards.

Paulo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 98270463
WEARNES Www.wearnesauto.com  juan.paulo@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



