Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 2:19 PM

To: MTPRI; assignments; SUR

Cc: Gan Kwai Leng (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
Subject: RE: PRI for SLH4878Z - Our Insured: SHB1285H on 20.1.2022
Dear Hua Yen,

Thank you for the assignment.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 11:48 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>; Gan Kwai Leng (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <KwaiLeng.Gan@strides.com.sg>
Subject: FW: PRI for SLH4878Z - Our Insured: SHB1285H on 20.1.2022

Ref:TAX/01/22/2043
Dear Ms Summer
Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis.

TP: SLH4878Z

Insured: SHB1285H

Workshop:

Hui Huang Hong Bao Motors (SLH 48787)

2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2

#02-11. Kaki Bukit Autohub

Singapore (417921)

Tel : 9732 2327/6844 7414 Fax : 6844 7401

Thank you.

Regards,

Hua Yen
Claim Department

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705
DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg




From: Aini Binte <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: 24 January 2022 12:41

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg>; Lim Igene <igene@axalt.sg>;
alisonhhhb@gmail.com; Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI for SLH4878Z - Our Insured: SHB1285H on 20.1.2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender
and are expecting the content or attachment.

Dear Hua Yen

For PRI.

Thanks & Regards

Aini
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849| Company Reg. No. 195000106C

A Member of IRERENNY INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of
us are on Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our
clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.

We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.

From: Lim Igene <igene@axalt.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 24, 2022 12:27 PM

To: Aini Binte <Aini(@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Hui Huang Hong Bao Motors Alison <alisonhhhb@gmail.com>

Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY | ACCIDENT ON 20 JAN 2022 INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLH 4878Z AND SHB
1285H

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

OUR REF : ALL.H1.2200437.1G
YOUR REF : SHB 1285H

Dear Sir

We refer to the captioned matter.

Please find attached our client’s NOTICE OF ACCIDENT dated 24 January 2022.

Thanks & Best Regards,



IGENE LIM (MS)
(For and on behalf of Ms Tan May Yee)

AXALT LAWLLC

Advocates & Solicitors
(UEN No. 202038023 M)
66 Tannery Lane
#01-04i, Sindo Building
Singapore 347805

Tel : 6547 0082

Fax : 6547 0083

Email : igene@axalt.sg

Service of documents will not be accepted by email.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : This email is intended solely for the above named addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally
privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-
operation.

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or
contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any error or omission or damage that may arise in the context of this message

which arise as a result of internet transmission.

Thank you.



