Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 2:38 PM

To: Ng Mei Yen

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALIZE - SLN6536R

Attachments: 01032022135558-0001.pdf; SLN 6536 main estimate.pdf
Hi Mei Yen,

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $15,376.60 (P/P before GST) - with 6 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 1:57 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALIZE - SLN6536R

Hi Steve
Here attach with the amend estimate.

Thank you
MeiYen

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com
Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 1:29 pm

To: Ng Mei Yen MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg
Subject: FINALIZE - SLN6536R




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Mei Yen,

Kindly take out the $720 labour. Not necessary.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Mei Yen <MeiYen.Ng@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 1 March 2022 10:26 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZE - SLN6536R

Hi Steve
Attach finalize report for your perusal & before paint photos, 6 day
Thank you

MeiYen
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