6/10/22, 2:14 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SMD 2631R Ref: 2022 22003808

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Fri 10/6/2022 2:14 PM

To: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>;Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Dear Sharon,

Enclosed our amended report.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 12:16 pm

To: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>; Reports (LKKAuto)
<report@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SMD 2631R Ref: 2022 22003808

Dear Sharon,

Will check and get back to you

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 11:34 AM

To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SMD 2631R Ref: 2022 22003808
Internal

Dear Huey Yon

Please check, the OD bill is not tally with survey report.
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Thank you.

Sharon Lim
Claims & Performance Management Department

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897
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From: Huey Yon <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, March 28, 2022 8:48 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXT] Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SMD 2631R Ref: 2022 22003808

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclose Survey Report of SMD 2631R

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@]lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933
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