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Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Julie Mangubat

Cc: Claims; 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)'; 'SUR'; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Accident involving SMW5027R and SJU4031E on 19.01.2022

Attachments: AGI-LKKInvoice-AC2202641.pdf; GIA Rpt.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; 

LKKPhoto.pdf; Resurvey Photo-1.pdf

Dear Julie, 
 

 

Enclose Survey Report of  SMW 5027R. 
 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards, 

Elaine | Reports 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 10 May 2022 10:18 AM 

To: Julie Mangubat; Reports (LKKAuto); assignments; SUR 

Subject: RE: Accident involving SMW5027R and SJU4031E on 19.01.2022 

 

Dear Julie, 
 

Please be informed that we are in the midst of preparing report. 
 

Dear Reports Team, 
 

Kindly expedite. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Julie Mangubat <julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, 7 May 2022 12:16 AM 

To: HD Perfect Autowork <hdperfectautowork@gmail.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR 

<sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving SMW5027R and SJU4031E on 19.01.2022 

Importance: High 
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Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir 

 

Please hold hands, we have yet to receive our survey report for this case. 
 

Aside to LKK 

 

Hi @assignments@lkkauto.com @sur@lkkauto.com @Nivitha (LKK Auto) 

 

Please let us have your survey report as PD LOD is in. 
 

Thank you, 

-Julie 

 

From: HD Perfect Autowork <hdperfectautowork@gmail.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 16 April 2022 1:37 pm 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: Accident involving SMW5027R and SJU4031E on 19.01.2022 

 

Dear All, 

 

Kindly refer to the attached LOD. 
 

Thank You. 

  

Regards, 

Shanelle Lim 

Mobile: 8297 9787 

HD Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd. 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09 

Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 415875 


