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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 24 February 2022 3:17 PM
To: shirleysohlc@gmail.com
Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC4/QBE22000592/Dgs3 *** 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1111R & SJR 663Z ON 12/01/2022 ***

Importance: High

Our Ref:  CC4/QBE22000592/Dgs3 
 
24 FEBRUARY 2022  
                                       
SOH LAY CHOO 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1111R & SJR 663Z ON 12/01/2022 
 
We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer (QBE 
Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance 
policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SJR 663Z. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 7 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
c.c.         QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd             
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

 



2

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>
Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 3:12 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: claims-singapore; Admin A
Subject: RE: VC014970 TP CLAIM YOUR REF EY1111R LKK REF : CC4/QBE22000592/Dgs3

Dear Cecilia 
 
Kindly proceed as per advice. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Jenny Toh   

Senior Assistant    

Claims | Asia   

1 Wallich Street, #35-01, Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881   

+65 64771225   

     
Website LinkedIn Twitter    

 

 

 

 

    

       
SBR Management Excellence Awards 2021 – Innovator of the Year & Team of the Year – General Insurance, Singapore 
Insurance Asia Awards 2021 – Claims Initiative of the Year, Singapore 
Insurance Business Asia List – Elite Women 2021, Asia and Top Insurance Workplaces 2020, Asia  
AustCham Singapore Business Awards – Business Excellence Award 2021 and Digital Capability Award 2020, Singapore  

 
 
 

I work flexibly and may send emails outside normal working hours. If you have received an email from me outside of your 
normal business hours I am not expecting you to read or respond unless it is urgent. 

 
From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 1:36 pm 
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 
Cc: claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: VC014970 TP CLAIM YOUR REF EY1111R LKK REF : CC4/QBE22000592/Dgs3 
 

This email was sent from someone outside of QBE. Be cautious opening links and attachments. Use the ‘Report Phishing’ button if 
suspicious. 

  

QBE Ref: VC014970 

LKK Ref: CC4/QBE22000592/Dgs3 
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Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 21/02/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

This is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “ALFRED AUTO SERVICES & SUPPLIES” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 18,462.00 $ 3,300.00 
2. Loss of Use (6days x $100.00) $      600.00 $    600.00 (6days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          7.45 $        7.45 

Total $ 19,069.45 $ 3,907.45 

  

**04days recommendation for repair + 1sunday + 1PRS = 6days. 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and  

reference. 

 

Kindly note that this inspection report dated 23/05/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 

 

  

The above is for your approval. 

 
 
 




