Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 February 2022 2:31 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SHIPPING DOCUMENTS

Subject: FBQ1580QY claim repair cost

Hi Veron,

The motorcycle submit total loss. Workshop don’t want repair.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SHIPPING DOCUMENTS <ahfookmotor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 10 February 2022 12:20 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: FBQ1580Y claim repair cost

From: SHIPPING DOCUMENTS <ahfookmotor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 10, 2022 12:18 PM

To: HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FBQ1580Y claim repair cost

hi
Due to our surveryer come to servey, this bike seriously damaged, and the chasis is bend and not save to
repair and drive on road, so we decide to claim as total lose..

From: HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, January 7, 2022 11:45 AM

To: SHIPPING DOCUMENTS <ahfookmotor@hotmail.com>; HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg>
Subject: RE: FBQ1580Y claim repair cost



Without Prejudice
Save As To Cost

Dear Sirs,

Please assist to provide us with our insured policy number or insured name in order for us to look into this matter
and assist soonest.
At the same time, appreciate if you could re-forward all the supporting documents to expedite this matter.

We await your response soonest.
Should you have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact us. Thank you!

Best Regards,
Lynn Romeo
Claims Department

% HL Assurance

A Member of the Hong Leong Group

11 Keppel Road #11-01, ABI Plaza, Singapore 089057
T+65 6922 6025 | F+65 6221 3782
jonnalyn.romeo@hlas.com.sg | www.hlas.com.sg
Reaching out to you at Facebook | Twitter|Linkedin |

From: SHIPPING DOCUMENTS [mailto:ahfookmotor@hotmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 7 January 2022 9:26 am

To: HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg>

Subject: FBQ1580Y claim repair cost

Hi
For whom it may concern

Please be informed to arrange a pre accident survey to our work shop located at
No 5 Soon Lee Street
#01-15 Pioneer Point S627607

Regards
Ivy Kho



62503384 /81011733






Sent from my iPhone



