Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Friday, 17 June 2022 10:26 AM

Janet Tan

Admin A; dannysk yeo

RE: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref:
CC6/AIG22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X
ON 09/12/2021]

DV_SMZ 236X.pdf

We confirm settlement at $6,067.45(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client’s authorisation to act to us (LKK) for

our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 5:42 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref: CC6/AIG22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021]

Dear Hsiao,

Please accept $6,067.45 (all in), thank you!

Regards,



Janet Tan

On Thu, Jun 16, 2022 at 5:10 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,050.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)



From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 11:51 AM

To: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref: CC6/AIG22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021]

Without Prejudice

HiJanet,

Received with thanks.

We are currently pending mandate approval from AlG.

We will follow up and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)



From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 28 May 2022 12:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref: CC6/A1G22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021]

Dear Hsiao,

| enclosed herewith the Police letter of completed investigations which revealed that your driver of SLQ8859E had
committed the offence, see attached.

Kindly let us have this settlement immediately.

Note*please inform AIG insurance company to update our company address as follow (due they still send the
cheque to wrong unit):-

YSK AUTO WORKSHOP

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-71
@AUTOBAY

SINGAPORE 417883

ATTN: JANET TAN

Thank you!

Regards,

Janet Tan



On Thu, Apr 7, 2022 at 8:17 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 06/04/2022.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 April 2022 7:07 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; dannysk yeo
<dannyskyeo@gmail.com>




Subject: Re: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref: CC6/AIG22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021]

Dear Hsiao,

Our Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref: CC6/A1G22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021]

We act for ONG TZE HOW (WANG ZHIHAO), the owner of motor vehicle
no.SMZ236X.

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you/your insured in
connection with a road traffic accident on 09/12/2021 INVOLVING VEHICLES

NOS. SMZ 236X AND SLQ8859E(AIG) ALONG EAST COAST RD NEAR ST
PATRICK'S SCHOOL involving our client’s vehicle registration
number SMZ 236X and vehicle registration

number SLQ8859E(AIG) driven by your insured at the material
time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving
and /or management of your insured vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s
vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, particulars of
which are as follow:-

Particular Amount

1. COST OF REPAIR & LABOUR $5,500.00
2. LOSS OF USE, 05 Days X @$160.00 per day $. 800.00
3. Pre-Repair Inspection for 2 days x @$120.00 per day $. 320..00
4. GIA/LTA SEARCH FEE $ 7.45
5. TOWING FEE $ 80.00

Singapore Dollars: Six Thousand Seven Hundred Seven and Cents Forty-Five Only

Total S$:  6,707.45
We enclose a copy of each of the following documents for your consideration: -
1. (a) Repair Bill
2. (b) LTA Search/receipt on GBD6370Y

(c) Towing Fee



The demand herein is in respect of our client’s claim for damages pertaining to his
motor vehicle and any settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation
to his personal injuries.

Please confirm upon receipt.

Thank you!

Regards,

Janet Tan

YSK Auto Workshop

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 @AutoBay #01-71 SIingapore 417883

HP#9248 1057

On Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 3:23 PM Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Hsiao,

Well noted, we will submit once receipt COR finalised.

Thank you!

Regards,

Janet Tan

On Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 1:30 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice



HiJanet,

Please advise if COR has been finalised with our surveyor. If yes, please submit LOD & documents for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 18 February 2022 1:00 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref: CC6/A1G22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021]

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Please advise the payment status!
Thanks.

Regards,



Janet Tan

Sent from my iPhone

On 17 Jan 2022, at 13:21, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

HiJanet,

Received with thanks.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 January 2022 11:55 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [Request for Video Footage] - Your Ref: SMZ236X //LKK Ref:
CC6/AIG22000353/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON
09/12/2021]




Dear Hsiao Tong,

See attached as per your request.

Thanks!

Regards,

Janet Tan

On Mon, Jan 17, 2022 at 10:01 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SMZ236X Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC6/A1G22000353/Aps3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 8859E(AIG) AND SMZ 236X ON 09/12/2021

We refer to the above matter.

We would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client accident report or
our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)
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