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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 24 January 2022 1:29 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 2766 K & SMP 1187 A ON 6 JANUARY 2022 - CALL FOR 

DIRECT SETTLEMENT
Attachments: GBE2766K_estimate_finalisation.pdf; GBE2766K_invoice.pdf; GBE2766K_report.pdf; 

GBE2766K_rental_invoice.pdf; SMP1187A_ins_search.pdf

Your Ref:   
Our Ref : GBE 2766 K  
   
24 January 2022  
   
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd                                   PROPERTY CLAIM 
AIG Building,                                                                 (WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
78 Shenton Way                                                            TO: Any Personal Injury 
#07-16                                                                         Claims)    
Singapore 079120    
     
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,    
Ubi Avenue 1,    
#02-25    
Singapore 408933    
  
Attn: Claims Department  
   
Dear Sir/Mdm,  
   
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 2766 K & SMP 1187 A ON 6 JANUARY 2022 - CALL FOR DIRECT 
SETTLEMENT  
   
Kindly find attached the finalized report for GBE 2766 K, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to 
inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.  
   
As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving GBE 
2766 K & SMP 1187 A on 6 January 2022.  We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount 
as stated below:  
   
Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE)                    : $   3,500.00  
Cost of Rental                                                                             :$   720.00  
LTA Search                                                                   :  $       7.45  
  
   
   
Total:                                                                          :  $ 4,227.45  
   
We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next 
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if 
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.  
   





Winnie
Stamp









Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 08 Jan 2022 / 13:27:52

Receipt Date/Time : 08 Jan 2022 / 13:27:51

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220108-001162

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SMP1187A
As at 06 Jan 2022/14:35:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - SMP1187A
Enquiry Fee 
20220108132654658297

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

20220108132709181
Direct Debit: eNETS Debit 

(Internet Banking)
7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 17 January 2022 10:12 AM
To: 'georgehp1688@yahoo.com'; 'Brendalum1997@gmail.com'
Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 1187A(AIG) AND GBE 2766K 

AT/ALONG NEAR 700A ANG MO KIO AVE 6 ON 06/01/2022

17 Jan 2022 
                                                                
Mr Lum Hoong Piew                                                   [By Email Only] 
Driver: Lum Zing Yee, Brenda 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SMP1187A 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG22000295/Ups3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 1187A(AIG) AND GBE 2766K AT/ALONG NEAR 700A ANG MO KIO AVE 6 ON 
06/01/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from GBE2766K against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour as 
your driver changed lane and collided with third party. Under Motor Accident Guide, vehicle should keep in the 
proper lane and change lane only when it is safe Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more 
cost. Please be assured that we will do our due diligence to mitigate the cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> -. [A] Lee Su Li

2
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Clm Veh Model
Changed (206086) ADIVA AD1 200 190cc 3W. [A] Lee Su Li

3
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Clm Created
Reg No: GBE2766K. Acct Date: 2022/01/06. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asi
a Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Lt
d (HQ)

[A] Lee Su Li

4
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] Lee Su Li

5
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/01/19 [A] Lee Su Li

6
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] Lee Su Li

7
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Paci
fic Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) [A] Merimen Administrator

8
10 Jan
2022
15:14

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen Administrator

9
10 Jan
2022
15:15

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] Lee Su Li

10
10 Jan
2022
15:15

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA [A] Lee Su Li

11
10 Jan
2022
15:16

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: - -> BUILD & BLOOM PTE LTD. [A] Lee Su Li

12
10 Jan
2022
15:16

Clm Veh Model
Changed (206086) -> (204748) TOYOTA DYNA 1.5T 3.0 (M). [A] Lee Su Li

13
11 Jan
2022
09:43

Clm Registration
Modified Pol No:7210007276->1900161105. [I] Mohdsalim,

Mohamadammarramdzan

14
12 Jan
2022
10:41

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Boyogan, Joane

15
12 Jan
2022
10:42

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Boyogan, Joane

16
12 Jan
2022
14:24

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Boyogan, Joane

17
12 Jan
2022
14:24

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Boyogan, Joane

18
13 Jan
2022
11:01

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

19
13 Jan
2022
11:01

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

20
13 Jan
2022
11:01

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

21
13 Jan
2022
11:01

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

22
13 Jan
2022
11:01

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

23
17 Jan
2022
07:39

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

24
17 Jan
2022
16:29

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Loh, Chee-Heng

25
17 Jan
2022
16:30

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] MdNoor, Norsiah

26
17 Jan
2022
16:31

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] MdNoor, Norsiah

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=107710765&CFTOKEN=ee3475274901983f-F92EAC9E-B99A-7ECC-B211935A5CF3E63C&USID=3251&RID=5388060
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=107710765&CFTOKEN=ee3475274901983f-F92EAC9E-B99A-7ECC-B211935A5CF3E63C&USID=3251&RID=5388060
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=107710765&CFTOKEN=ee3475274901983f-F92EAC9E-B99A-7ECC-B211935A5CF3E63C&USID=3251&RID=5388060
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  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

27
19 Jan
2022
14:56

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

28
19 Jan
2022
14:56

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

29
19 Jan
2022
14:57

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

30
09 Mar
2022
13:52

Adj Rpt Initiated [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN

31
09 Mar
2022
13:52

Clm Dtl Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN

32
09 Mar
2022
13:52

Clm Dtl Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2015/10/20. [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN

33
09 Mar
2022
13:52

Clm Details
Notified [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN

34
12 May
2023
08:30

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2007.45:Liability: 50% *Quantum: $2,007.45 (all-in). Pls refer to ad
juster report for details. *For your approval please. [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

35
17 May
2023
09:26

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/01/19. Mandate Remarks: please proceed
with settlement @ $2007.45 [COR-$3500 LOU-$500 @ 50% LTA- $7.45] ** s
ubject to final repair bill and ATA

[I] Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

36
17 May
2023
09:26

Adj Mandate Set Approved:2007.45:please proceed with settlement @ $2007.45 [COR-$3500
LOU-$500 @ 50% LTA- $7.45] ** subject to final repair bill and ATA [I] Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
[25/01/2022 12:14] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
*KIV FOR PIR
[17/01/2022 16:42] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Spoken to OI Mr Lum. He is of the view that TP shold be more liable as 1) TP turned out from minor road without stop at the stopline. (2) OID
checked the left lane is cleared before filtered out while TP was turning directly to 2nd lane from the left instead of 1st lane from the left.(3)
Case is under investigation. KIV PIR from OI. OI will update us on PIR

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2756208 10 Jan 2022
15:18:19

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

GBE2766K SMP1187A 11.00

2757006 12 Jan 2022
14:23:32 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

GBE2766K Boyogan,
Joane xx.xx

2772392 09 Mar 2022
13:52:59

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

GBE2766K SMP1187A 11.00


