Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 February 2022 10:07 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLN 5055T

Case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: EM Auto [mailto:emautosolution@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 February, 2022 5:04 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLN 5055T

Hi Rasul
Confirmed Lump Sum $2550.00 — 4 working days.
Thank you.

Sirina Soon
Senior Claim Executive

E M Solution Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#03-18/19 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel, 64560226

Fax. 64584500

HP. 92236288

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 February, 2022 9:30 AM

To: emautosolution@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLN 5055T

Hi Mdm,

Any update?



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 February, 2022 10:31 AM
To: 'emautosolution@singnet.com.sg’
Subject: SLN 5055T

Hi Mdm,

Refer to attachment

Take note, audit checked 1 of the item part prices slightly high, necessary adjustment
has to be made.

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $2,550.00/- with 4 days of
repair, subject to their approval

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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