Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 February 2022 8:59 AM
To: Thomas Pang PTCBC

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalize Report SLZ1418T

Hi Thomas,

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of P/P BEFORE excess $9,492.60/- with 7
days of repair, subject to their approval

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

SERER NETT Sve the Larthe Print only when recessary-

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC [mailto:Thomas.Pang @borneomotors.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 25 February, 2022 12:07 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalize Report SLZ1418T

Dear Rasul,

Attach finalize report for your perusal. 07 working days.
Thank you

Regards

Thomas pang



