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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 10:57 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMR9391M - SMRT TP - Finalization

Dear Guo Qiang, 
 
 
Please proceed. 
 
Thanks and best regards, 
Elaine 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

 

 

On Mon, 28 Mar 2022 at 17:14, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Raymond, 

  

“Without Prejudice” 

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $ 6350 /- with 6 days of repair, subject to their approval. 

  

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 
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发件人: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg> 

发送时间: 2022年 3月 1日 16:13 

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

抄送: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

主题: Re: SMR9391M - SMRT TP - Finalization  

  

Good afternoon, 
 
1 pc Front RH headlamp 92102-F2720 $3035 
1 pc Front RH fender 66320-F2500 $1227 
1 pc Front RH wheel rim 52910-F2BA1 $1298 
1 pc Front RH wheel bearing 51750-F2000 $$453 
 
Please double confirm the parts pricing 
 
We all double checked ald 
 
Thanks! 
Best Regards 
Raymond Teo 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

 

 

On Mon, 28 Feb 2022 at 10:51, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Raymond, 

  

“Without Prejudice” 

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $ 4900 /- with 6 days of repair, subject to their approval. 
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Regards, 

Guo Qiang 

  

  

From: VAuG Claims [mailto:claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg]  

Sent: Saturday, 26 February, 2022 5:08 PM 

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: SMR9391M - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  

Good afternoon, 

  

Can we finalize the case? 

  

Thanks! 

Best Regards 

Raymond Teo 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

  

  

On Sat, 5 Feb 2022 at 10:28, VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg> wrote: 

Good morning, 

  

Can we finalize the case? 

  

Thanks! 

Best Regards 

Raymond Teo 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 
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** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

  

  

On Sat, 22 Jan 2022 at 10:14, VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg> wrote: 

Good morning, 

  

Can we finalize the case? 

  

Thanks! 

Best Regards 

Raymond Teo 
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