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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 October 2022 9:09 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Liew Si Ming

Cc: Ramesh; Catherine Chong Kai Ling; SUR

Subject: SKX5940Y FINALISE

Attachments: SKX5940Y FINALISE.pdf; SKX 5940 main estimate and supp.pdf

Dear Si Ming, 
 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $18,093.22 with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval.  
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 19 October 2022 8:50 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si 

Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: SKX5940Y FINALISE 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

I`ve checked the finalize. Kindly assist. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 18 October 2022 3:20 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: SKX5940Y FINALISE  

  

Hi Steve, 

  

  

Please kindly assist to finalise. 

Thank You. 

  

  

 

Liew Si Ming | Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 
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