Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 January 2022 6:00 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SMR4949M / OD / 31/12/2021 / Coverage & Excess update

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 January 2022 6:00:01 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMR4949M / OD / 31/12/2021 / Coverage & Excess update

This mail is associated with :
*SIMIR4949M (6472123501SG)
oD
Dec 31 2021 6:00AM
[KEE POH KWANG (JI BAOGUANG)]
Cycle & Carriage KIA Pte Ltd
Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please note that policy is in force and excess amount is $600.00

Thank you
Nadaraja, Deeban

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.

Sent by : Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.)



