Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 12:25 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: #£4&: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

& A: Enquiry <srautoworks.claims@gmail.com>

B&i%: 2022512828H 12:25:39 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
%A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

$#bi%: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

ZERE: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,

Thank you for your response.
We refer to your below email dated on 10 November 2022. Finalization offer accepted at $2,850, 4 Repair Days
However, we will amend the LOD and resend it to your principal office.

Thank you

Best Regards
SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2022 10:31 AM

To: srautoworks.claims@gmail.com

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: [2] 5 : FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Hi Damian,
Attached

Regards,
Guo Qiang

BN srautoworks.claims@gmail.com <srautoworks.claims@gmail.com>
AiXME: 2022511590 12:24

W44 A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>

$L3%: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

ZFERR: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,
Please send us your marked estimates. As we are unable to accept your proposed amount.

Thanks

Damian

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 6:32 PM

To: Accounts <srautoworks.claims@gmail.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [6] 52 : FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Hi,
“Without Prejudice”
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair $2850 before GST/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

RN : Accounts <srautoworks.claims@gmail.com>
RIERTE]: 202243 H15H 13:57

ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>
FEfH: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,



Any updates on the finalization offer for the above case ?
Thank you.
Best Regards,

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: srautoworks.claims@gmail.com

From: Accounts

Sent: Wednesday, 2 March 2022 2:22 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,

Any updates on the finalization offer for the above case ? @
Thank you.
Best Regards,

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

From: Accounts

Sent: Thursday, 24 February 2022 1:28 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,

Is the finalization offer for the above case ready ?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

From: SR Autoworks

Sent: Saturday, 19 February 2022 7:15 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

HI Guo Qiang,

Attached after paints on Wed, Jan 5, 5:40 PM
Please kindly assist to finalize this case asap
Thank you.

Regards,
SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

On Tue, Feb 15, 2022 at 6:23 PM Accounts <srautoworks.claims@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Guo Qiang,
| refer to the estimate list for this case .

Lumpsum @ $5,791.51 4 days .

If agreeable, kindly acknowledge. Else, please update us on the finalization offer @
Thank you.
Best Regards,

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

From: SR Claims
Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 12:05 PM
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)




Cc: srautoworks.enquiry@gmail.com
Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,

Kindly advise on the status of the finalization for the said vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Prescelia Hoe

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

Co. & UEN. No.: 202143122R

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: srautoworks.claims@gmail.com

From: Accounts [mailto:srautoworks.claims@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 20, 2022 4:07 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,
Any updates on the finalization offer for the above case ?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jesski Low

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

Co. & UEN. No.: 202143122R

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: srautoworks.claims@gmail.com

From: Accounts

Sent: Tuesday, 11 January 2022 1:35 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,
Is the finalization offer for the above case ready ? @
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jesski Low

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

Co. & UEN. No.: 202143122R

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: srautoworks.claims@gmail.com

From: Accounts

Sent: Wednesday, 5 January 2022 5:40 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALIZATION FOR SGD 9335 X - KIA CERATO

Dear Guo Qiang,

Attached after paints.



Kindly assist to finalize this case @
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jesski Low

SR AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

Co. & UEN. No.: 202143122R

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: srautoworks.claims@gmail.com




