3/17/22, 11:09 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Fw: Finalisation of SJE 6733)

Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com>
Thu 17/3/2022 11:06 AM
To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Joseph Koh <claims@bifrostauto.com>; Claims Dept
<claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>

Without Prejudice
Dear Mr Lim,

Thank You so much for your prompt replies to us, and for helping to expedite on the finalization amts
for many of our Vehicle numbers.

We do appreciate it very much for your help.

We accept the finalized amount of LS $4,050/- 7 Days of repair for Vehicle number: SJE 6733 J
We will follow up with the LOD shortly.

Thank you.

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising
therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Best Regards,

Andrew

Motor Claims Department
BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD

On Thu, 17 Mar 2022 at 10:55, TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Andrew,

We will be advising our Principal an amended cost of repair of LS $4,050/- with 7 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

My apologies for my omission of some figures in the calculation.

Best Regards,

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwWMGFhNWIXNAAQAEYRMmIeNPFBrFtSJas2wZ...  1/5



3/17/22, 11:09 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2022 10:22 AM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: Finalisation of SJE 6733)J

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 March 2022 9:56 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>; Joseph Koh <claims@bifrostauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalisation of SJE 6733

Without Prejudice

Dear Denise,

Thank You so much for the re-upload of the new adjusted Marked Estimate for Vehicle number: SJE
6733 J

We have tabulated the amounts and have included these parts as follows:

PARTS

ITEM NO 19 (Rear Bumper Reinforcement) AMT - $398.70

LABOUR

ITEM NO 1 (Transfer Rear Bootlid Mechanism Lock) AMT -$80

We have reached an amount of $4,050. Can you please tally the amount with us and can we Finalize
and close at the amount of LS $4,050/-7Days of repair for Vehicle no: SJE 6733 J

Your help is Deeply Appreciated.

Thank you.
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The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages
arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Best Regards,

Andrew

Motor Claims Department
BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD

On Thu, 17 Mar 2022 at 08:17, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Andrew,

Sorry for the blur estimate.

Enclosed a clearer estimate

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 16 March 2022 5:37 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalisation of SJE 6733

Without Prejudice

Dear Denise,

Please do re send a copy of the adjusted Marked Estimate so that we can tally the finalized
amount as the top portion is too blurred out to see and tally the amounts indicated, for Vehicle
number: SJE 6733 J

Thank you.

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages
arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.
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Best Regards,

Andrew

Motor Claims Department
BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD

On Wed, 16 Mar 2022 at 16:27, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi,

any updates?

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $3,750/- with 7 days of repair, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 2:42 pm

To: Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com>
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: Finalisation of SJE 6733)

Hi Suanne,
Any update on the status of this vehicle?

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto)
Sent: Sunday, January 9, 2022 11:25 AM
To: Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com>
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Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Finalisation of SJE 6733)

Hi Suanne,
Without Prejudice
Attached is the adjusted estimate of SJE 6733

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $3,750/- with 7 days of repair, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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