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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 February 2022 5:37 pm
To: Tan Lee Gek (StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Cecilia Chong (LKK 

Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Fw: LOD   Re: Accident on 18/12/2021 involving SHD 6123Z & SLZ 137K (AIG's insured)  

(Our Ref: TAX/12/21/2044/lg)  LKK REF : CC3/AIG21013309/Ggs3
Attachments: 12 21 2044 - documents.pdf; 12 21 2044 - repair bill.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam,  
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Cecilia, 
 
FYNA, CC3/AIG21013309/Ggs3 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 9, 2022 5:31 PM 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 18/12/2021 involving SHD 6123Z & SLZ 137K (AIG's insured) (Our Ref: TAX/12/21/2044/lg)  
  
Dear All, 
  
We quantify our claim as follows:-  

       
Cost of Repair $1,179.03           
Loss of Rental $657.00 ( 9 days x $73.00 ) 



2

Loss of Income $540.00 ( 9 days x $60.00 ) 
LTA Search Fee $7.00           
Total $2,383.03           

  
We enclose the following documents:  

1) Repair invoice  
2) Proof of rental rate 
3) GIA report  
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5) Hirer’s letter of authorization  
6) LTA search 
  

Please acknowledge receipt within 14 days from the date hereof and let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
  
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 10 February 2022 8:59 am
To: norazman.i.abdul_aziz@daimler.com
Cc: valKrish@yahoo.com
Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC3/AIG21013309/Ggs3 *** ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SLZ 137K & SHD 6123Z ON 18/12/2021 ***

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC3/AIG21013309/Ggs3            
                                                                                                 
10 FEBRUARY 2022 
 
DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE. LTD 
DRIVER: NARAYANAN VINOD KHRISHNAN 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 137K & SHD 6123Z ON 18/12/2021 

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your 
Motor Insurer (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your 
authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SHD 6123Z. 
             
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore 
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, 
please contact us within 3 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a 
NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 

 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 2:59 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: Returned of DV   Re: Accident on 18/12/2021 involving SHD 6123Z & SLZ 137K (AIG's 

insured)  (Our Ref: TAX/12/21/2044/lg)  LKK REF : CC3/AIG21013309/Ggs3
Attachments: 0808_001.pdf

Dear Cecilia, 
 
We attach the duly signed DV and ATA for your necessary action. Please let us have AIG’s payment for $1,924.03 
payable to STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD via bank transfer, details as follows:- 
 
Name of Beneficiary : STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD 
Name of Bank : DBS Bank Ltd 
Address of Bank : 12 Marina Boulevard 

  DBS Asia Central  

  Marina Bay Financial Centre Tower 3 

  Singapore 018982  
Bank Account No. : 018-008271-3  
Bank Code  : 7171 
Branch Code : 018 
Swift Code : DBSSSGSG 

 
Thanks. 
 
Please forward this email to your principal so that they will make payment to the correct claimant as stated.  
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
 

 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 May 2022 4:45 pm 
To: Tan Lee Gek (StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Accident on 18/12/2021 involving SHD 6123Z & SLZ 137K (AIG's insured) (Our Ref: TAX/12/21/2044/lg) LKK 
REF : CC3/AIG21013309/Ggs3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Lee Gek,  
 
We are pleased to settle as per your proposal of $1,924.03 (all-in).  
 


