Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 March 2022 10:38 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: YP 5660G

From: sunny <sunny@jitkeong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 March 2022 10:37:33 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Rasul
We accept the finalize lump sum repair cost of $4000 bf gst with 10 days repair.

Thank you!

Regards
Sunny Yeoh

JIT KEONG TRADING CO. PTE. LTD
28 Benoi Place Singapore 629945
Tel : 6863 4186 Fax : 6861 3533

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 10, 2022 10:28 AM

To: sunny <sunny@jitkeong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Mr Sunny,

As spoken, We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $4,000.00/- with 10 days
of repair, subject to their approval

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥F L7L”

SERER WWT Sive the Larthe Print only whernr necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 10 March, 2022 9:25 AM



To: sunny
Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Mr Sunny,

As spoken, kindly expedite

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥ ESLS

SERER WWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 March, 2022 9:51 AM
To: sunny

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Boss,

Kindly confirm the finalised amount at 3800

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EFES e
SemmE= mww Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March, 2022 12:28 PM
To: sunny

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Boss,

Any update?

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EFES e
SemmEwm e Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 February, 2022 9:29 AM
To: sunny

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Boss,

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥ ESES

SERER WWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 February, 2022 10:03 AM
To: sunny

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Mr Sunny,

Close at 3,800

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥ ESLS

SERER WWT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 February, 2022 9:44 AM
To: 'sunny'

Subject: RE: YP 5660G



Hi Mr Sunny,

We have audit part checked on our side.
| can considered item 1 at 1200 and item 3 at 650

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EFES e
SR mE = e Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

From: sunny [mailto:sunny@jitkeong.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 14 February, 2022 2:07 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YP 5660G

Hi Rasul
Thanks for your reply, and there is some item need to make some adjustment.

Item 1- $1400
3- $750 Nett (this is our cost price)
Plc considered

Thank you!

Regards
Sunny Yeoh

JIT KEONG TRADING CO. PTE. LTD
28 Benoi Place Singapore 629945
Tel : 68634186 Fax : 6861 3533

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 11:13 AM

To: sunny@jitkeong.com.sg

Subject: YP 5660G

Hi Sunny,
Refer to attachment

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $3,650.00 /- with 10 days of repair, subject to their approval



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥FLLS T

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary



