Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 5:12 PM

To: Clement Chia Cher Yang

Cc: Azman Abdullah; Katherine Chong; Andy Ooi Lee Keong; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SLB1510K Final Invoice

Hi Clement,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of P/P $29,220.75 /- with 07 days of
repair, subject to their approval

From: Clement Chia Cher Yang <clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 4:34 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Azman Abdullah <azman.abdullah@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Andy Ooi Lee Keong <andy.ooi.leekeong@simedarby.com.sg>; Veron Chen
(LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLB1510K Final Invoice

Dear Rasul,
Please see revised invoice.
All good?

Best Regards,
Clement Chia

Customer Service Advisor, Body & Paint

Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road, #02-01 Vantage Automotive Centre, Singapore 159942
T: 4659278 2710 F: +65 6477 7300 E: clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg
www.simedarbymotors.com | www.vantageauto.com.sqg

Embrace the Vantage ONE Experience

Discover the convenience of car ownership with the Vantage ONE App

Download on the ‘ GET ITON

‘ @& AppStore P Google Play

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Clement Chia Cher Yang

Sent: Wednesday, April 6, 2022 2:29 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Azman Abdullah <azman.abdullah@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Andy Ooi Lee Keong <andy.ooi.leekeong@simedarby.com.sg>; Veron Chen
(LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLB1510K Final Invoice



Dear Rasul,

Attached for your review before we close this invoice.

Best Regards,
Clement Chia

Customer Service Advisor, Body & Paint

Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road, #02-01 Vantage Automotive Centre, Singapore 159942
T: +65 9278 2710 F: +65 6477 7300 E: clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg

www.simedarbymotors.com | www.vantageauto.com.sg

Embrace the Vantage ONE Experience
Discover the convenience of car ownership with the Vantage ONE App

GETITON

> Google Play

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 6, 2022 10:17 AM

To: Clement Chia Cher Yang <clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Azman Abdullah <azman.abdullah@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Andy Ooi Lee Keong <andy.ooi.leekeong@simedarby.com.sg>; Veron Chen
(LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLB1510K Final Invoice

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organisation. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know
the content is safe. Click “Report Phishing” if you think it is malicious.

Hi Clement,

As spoken, the finalised invoice need to reduce 10% discount of the list part price.

From: Clement Chia Cher Yang <clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 March 2022 3:31 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Azman Abdullah <azman.abdullah@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>; Andy Ooi Lee Keong <andy.ooi.leekeong@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: SLB1510K Final Invoice

Dear Rasul,
Attached as per requested.

Best Regards,
Clement Chia

Customer Service Advisor, Body & Paint

Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road, #02-01 Vantage Automotive Centre, Singapore 159942
T: +65 9278 2710 F: +65 6477 7300 E: clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg
www.simedarbymotors.com | www.vantageauto.com.sq
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“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



