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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 December 2021 2:51 PM

To: assignments; SUR

Cc: MTPRI; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Tan Wei Teck 

(Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Foo Chit Yan (Strides Automotive Services Pte 

Ltd)

Subject: FW: D21003442MFBP/SMRT/EL SMN9256S YOUR REF: SMB91Y PRE REPAIR 

INSPECTION FOR   SMN9256S

Attachments: SC1R21CE0003_14-12-2021_100439.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Summer, 

 

Please refer to below email. 

 

Thanks & regards 

Hua Yen 

 

From: Harminder Kaur [mailto:Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  

Sent: 29/12/2021 10:40 
To: MTPRI 

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Esther Lim; My Car Consultant 

Subject: D21003442MFBP/SMRT/EL SMN9256S YOUR REF: SMB91Y PRE REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMN9256S 

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender 

and are expecting the content or attachment.  

Dear Hua Yen, 

 

Kindly refer to the attached email. 

TP withdraw claim. 

 

Thank You. 

 

 

Best Regards, 
Harminder Kaur 

Motor Claims  
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House,  Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C  

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
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From: Huiqin Tan <admin@mycar.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 December 2021 3:33 pm 

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: FWD: OUR REF: SMN9256S YOUR REF: SMB91Y PRE REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMN9256S 

 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We have made a mistake for this PRS, our client has sent us the wrong GIA and we will be withdrawing our claims against your 
insured. 
 
Please close this TP claim file on your end.  
 
Kindly divert all correspondent & disbursements to our new office address @ 60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre 
#05-21 S(737869) as we will no longer have access to our old address' mailbox.  
 
Best Regards,  
Huiqin 
General Manager | Motor Claims Department  
 
My Car Consultant Pte Ltd  
M: 8866 8832 | F: 6925 5219 
W: Mycar.sg | E: Admin@mycar.sg 
60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)  
UEN No.: 201605878Z 
GST Registration No.: 201605878Z  
 

From: "Huiqin Tan" <admin@mycar.sg> 
Sent: 12/24/21 5:38 PM 
To: "ms first capital" <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: OUR REF: SMN9256S YOUR REF: SMB91Y PRE REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMN9256S 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
                                 
                         * *Survey location: 60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-68       

OUR REF: SMN9256S 

YOUR REF: SMB91Y 
                                               

Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                               
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMN9256S 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN9256S AND SMB91Y 

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client's GIA report and Notification of Pre-repair inspection for your 
attention 

 
Kindly divert all correspondent & disbursements to our new office address @ 60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre 
#05-21 S(737869) as we will no longer have access to our old address' mailbox.  
 
Best Regards,  
Huiqin 
General Manager | Motor Claims Department  
 
My Car Consultant Pte Ltd  
M: 8866 8832 | F: 6925 5219 
W: Mycar.sg | E: Admin@mycar.sg 
60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)  
UEN No.: 201605878Z 
GST Registration No.: 201605878Z  


